
Product price per 

ton if vendor 

delivers to:

 Tulsa 

Asphalt 
APAC

United 

Materials

Broken Arrow Area  $ 41.71  $  40.15 45.25$   

Wagoner Area  $ 46.46 44.30$   No Bid

Lake Gibson Area  $ 47.71 No Bid No Bid

Okay Area  $ 47.71 No Bid No Bid

Coweta Area  $ 43.21 40.75$   46.40$   

Porter Area  $ 45.11 42.65$   No Bid

Red Bird Area  $ 43.86 41.35$   No Bid

Tullahassee Area  $ 46.71 44.30$   No Bid

Stone Bluff Area  $ 44.71 42.30$   No Bid

Bid Results



Product price per 

ton if vendor 

delivers to:

 Tulsa 

Asphalt 
APAC

United 

Materials

Broken Arrow Area  $ 46.19  $  45.15 47.45$   

Wagoner Area  $ 50.94 49.30$   No Bid

Lake Gibson Area  $ 52.19 No Bid No Bid

Okay Area  $ 52.19 No Bid No Bid

Coweta Area  $ 47.69 45.75$   48.65$   

Porter Area  $ 49.59 47.65$   No Bid

Red Bird Area  $ 48.34 46.35$   No Bid

Tullahassee Area  $ 51.19 49.30$   No Bid

Stone Bluff Area  $ 49.19 47.30$   No Bid

Bid Results



Product price per 

ton if vendor 

delivers to:

 Tulsa 

Asphalt 
APAC

United 

Materials

Broken Arrow Area  $ 47.80  $  49.15 51.65$   

Wagoner Area  $ 52.55 53.30$   No Bid

Lake Gibson Area  $ 53.80 No Bid No Bid

Okay Area  $ 53.80 No Bid No Bid

Coweta Area  $ 49.30 49.75$   52.85$   

Porter Area  $ 51.20 51.65$   No Bid

Red Bird Area  $ 49.95 50.35$   No Bid

Tullahassee Area  $ 52.80 53.30$   No Bid

Stone Bluff Area  $ 50.80 51.30$   No Bid

Bid Results


