OKLAHOMA UNIFORM BUILDING
CODE COMMISSION RULES

748 - Uniform Building Code Commission
Adopted Codes
International Mechanical Code®, 2009 Edition
(IMC®, 2009)
748:20-13-1 through 748:20-13-11

Notice: The rules of the Oklahoma Uniform Building Code found on
this website are unofficial. The official rules are published in The
Oklahoma Administrative Code and The Oklahoma Register, as required
by 75 O.S. § 250 et seq. To order an official copy of these rules, contact
the Office of Administrative Rules at: (405) 521-4911.



Chapter 20 - Adopted Codes

[Authority: 59 0.S. 59 § 1000.23]
[Source: Codified 7-15-11]

Subchapter 13 - IMC®2009

748:20-13-1. Adoption of International Mechanical Code®, 2009 Edition (IMC® 2009)

The Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission (the Commission) hereby adopts the
International Mechanical Code®, 2009 Edition as amended and modified in this subchapter as
the minimum code for commercial mechanical construction in the State of Oklahoma pursuant to
59 0.S. 1000.23.

[Source: Added at 29 Ok Reg 1659, eff 11-1-12]

748:20-13-2. Effect of Adoption

The International Mechanical Code®, 2009 Edition (IMC® 2009), as amended and revised
by these rules, are hereby established and adopted as the statewide minimum standards for
commercial mechanical construction in Oklahoma pursuant to 59 O.S. § 1000.23, and may only
be amended or altered by other jurisdictions pursuant to Oklahoma law and the administrative
rules of the Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission as set forth in Title 748, Chapter 15

of the Oklahoma Administrative Code.
[Source: Added at 29 Ok Reg 1659, eff 11-1-12]

748:20-13-3. IMC® 2009 Appendices

(a) None of the appendices of the IMC® 2009 have been adopted by the Commission for
inclusion in the minimum standards for commercial mechanical construction in the State of
Oklahoma.

(b) Appendices A through B are not adopted as the minimum standards for commercial
mechanical construction within the State of Oklahoma. However, other jurisdictions within this
State may adopt any or all of said appendices in accordance with 59 O.S. § 1000.29.

[Source: Added at 29 Ok Reg 1659, eff 11-1-12]

748:20-13-4. IMC® 2009 Provisions Adopted and Modified

All chapters and provisions within chapters, including exceptions, of the IMC® 2009 not
specifically addressed within these rules as being modified, deleted, moved or removed are
hereby adopted without modification as the minimum standards for commercial mechanical
construction within the State of Oklahoma pursuant to 59 O.S. § 1000.23. Chapters and
provisions within chapters, including exceptions adopted with modifications are specifically

addressed in these rules.
[Source: Added at 29 Ok Reg 1659, eff 11-1-12]

748:20-13-5. Participation in Federal Programs and/or Federally Funded or Financed
Projects

In order to maximize federal financial aid, assistance, participation, financing and/or funding
in any public project(s) and/or federal financial aid, participation, funding for and participation in
any federal program(s) by the State of Oklahoma, its agencies, public trusts and
instrumentalities, or by any Oklahoma municipalities and other political subdivisions, that
receive financial aid, assistance, participation, financing and/or funding for and participate in any
federal program(s), the State of Oklahoma, its agencies and instrumentalities, and any Oklahoma

2



municipalities and other political subdivisions, may cooperate with the United States
Government and any agency or instrumentality thereof, in the manner authorized and provided
by federal law and regulation and in doing so may perform all necessary functions and take all
necessary actions for accomplishing such federal purposes and programs, including but not
limited to, following and/or complying with federal laws, regulations and/or requirements arising
from or related to federal financial aid, assistance, participation, financing and/or funding, in the
construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and
occupancy, location, improvement, expansion, operation, maintenance, removal, and demolition
of buildings and structures or any appurtenances attached to such buildings or structures,
notwithstanding any provisions of any and all uniform building codes and standards adopted by

the Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission to the contrary.
[Source: Added at 29 Ok Reg 1659, eff 11-1-12]

748:20-13-6. IMC® 2009 Chapter 1 Scope and Administration
Chapter 1 the Oklahoma adopted IMC® 2009, includes the following Preamble at the very

beginning of the chapter:
(1) Pursuant to 59 O.S. § 1000.23, the Uniform Building Code Commission has adopted the
International Mechanical Code®, 2009 Edition (IMC® 2009) as amended and revised by the
Commission, as the minimum standards to be used by all entities for commercial mechanical
construction in jurisdictions throughout the State of Oklahoma. However, the Commission's
adoption of Chapter 1 "Scope and Administration™ of the IMC® 2009 is for continuity
purposes and the Commission's adoption of Chapter 1 recognizes the methods of best
practice in fully implementing the minimum standards for commercial mechanical
construction.
(2) All provisions of the adopted IMC® 2009, including Chapter 1, as amended and revised
by the Commission, are hereby established and adopted as the statewide minimum standards
for commercial mechanical construction in Oklahoma pursuant to 59 O.S. § 1000.23, which
may only be amended or altered pursuant to Oklahoma law and the administrative rules of
the Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission as set forth in Title 748, Chapter 15 of
the Oklahoma Administrative Code. However, the provisions of Chapter 1 adopted herein are
only intended to be in force and effect to the extent that the respective provisions do not
conflict with State law or the lawful exercise of code administration and enforcement
jurisdiction by entities empowered to do so pursuant to applicable law.
(3) The Commission's adoption of Chapter 1 in this manner is made with the recognition that
the legal authority granting state and local code administration and enforcement jurisdictions
the power and discretion to administer and enforce codes arises from Oklahoma laws
governing those jurisdictions. Furthermore, the Commission also recognizes that many state
and local code administration and enforcement jurisdictions have already created, or have the
lawful authority to create, departments, offices and administrative policies pursuant to
various applicable laws and other adopted model codes with "Scope and Administration™
provisions similar to Chapter 1 of the adopted IMC® 2009
(4) This limited adoption of Chapter 1 is made in recognition of the authority and discretion
possessed by jurisdictions to administer and enforce building codes. Exercising such
authority and jurisdiction in a manner inconsistent with Chapter 1 must be supported by
Oklahoma law. Code administration and enforcement jurisdictions shall not use the
Commission’'s limited adoption of Chapter 1 to circumvent the remainder of the requirements



established by the Oklahoma adopted IMC® 2009 and the Commission will strongly oppose

any such practice.
[Source: Added at 29 Ok Reg 1659, eff 11-1-12]

748:20-13-7. IMC 2009® Chapter 2 Definitions

Chapter 2 of the IMC® 2009 is adopted with the following changes: The definition of a
Commercial Cooking Appliance has been modified to further define a commercial cooking
appliance. The definition has been modified to read: Appliances used in a commercial food
service establishment for heating or cooking food and which produce grease vapors, steam,
fumes, smoke or odors that are required to be removed through a local ventilation system. Such
appliances include deep fat fryers; upright broilers; griddles; broilers; steam-jacketed kettles;
hot-top ranges; under-fired broilers (charbroilers); ovens; barbeques; rotisseries; and similar
appliances. For the purpose of this definition, a food service establishment shall include any
building or a portion thereof used for the preparation and serving of food that is not a kitchen in a

single-family dwelling unit or apartment.
[Source: Added at 29 Ok Reg 1659, eff 11-1-12]

748:20-13-8. IMC 2009® Chapter 3 General Regulations
Chapter 3 of the IMC® 2009 is adopted with the following modifications:
(1) Section 301.12 Wind resistance. This section has been modified to allow design and
installation of equipment and appliances that are exposed to wind to be built in accordance
with SMACNA HVAC Duct Construction Standards - Metal or Flexible or other approved
methods. This section has been modified to read: Mechanical equipment, appliances and
supports that are exposed to wind shall be designed and installed to resist the wind pressures
determined in accordance with the International Building Code, SMACNA HVAC Duct
Construction Standards - Metal and Flexible, or other approved methods.
(2) Section 304.11 Guards. This section has been modified to require guards around
components requiring routine service and unprotected skylight openings. This section has
been modified to read: Guards or parapet walls shall be provided where appliances,
equipment, fans (or other components that require routine service) or roof hatches are located
within 10 feet (3048 mm) of a roof edge or open side of a walking surface and such edge or
open side is located more than 30 inches (762 mm) above the adjacent surface or grade
below. The guards or parapet walls shall extend not less than 30 inches (762 mm) beyond
each end of such appliances, equipment, fans, components, and roof hatch openings; and the
top of the guard or parapet wall shall be located not less than 42 inches (1067 mm) above the
adjacent surface. Guards shall be constructed to prevent the passage of a 21-inch diameter
(533 mm) sphere and shall comply with the loading requirements for guards as specified in
the International Building Code®. Guards shall also be provided where appliances,
equipment, fans (or other components that require routine service) are located within 10 feet
(3048 mm) of a roof hatch or unprotected skylight. Skylights shall be considered protected if
the level of the lowest edge of the skylight is on a raised curb 42 inches (1067 mm) above the
roof level, or if the skylight is protected by some other approved means to prevent personnel

from falling through the opening.
[Source: Added at 29 Ok Reg 1659, eff 11-1-12]

748:20-13-9. IMC 2009® Chapter 5 Exhaust Systems
Chapter 5 of the IMC® 2009 has been adopted with the following modifications:

4



(1) Section 507.1 General. This section has been modified to add Section 507.9 to exception
number one. This section shall now read: Commercial kitchen exhaust hoods shall comply
with the requirements of this section. Hoods shall be Type I or 11 and shall be designed to
capture and confine cooking vapors and residues. Commercial kitchen exhaust hood systems
shall operate during the cooking operation. Exceptions:
(A) Factory-built commercial exhaust hoods which are tested in accordance with UL 710
listed, labeled and installed in accordance with Section 304.1 shall not be required to
comply with Sections 507.4, 507.7, 507.9, 507.11, 507.12, 507.13, 507.14 and 507.15.
(B) Factory-built commercial cooking recirculating systems which are tested in
accordance with UL 710B, listed, labeled, and installed in accordance with Section 304.1
shall not be required to comply with Sections 507.4, 507.5, 507.7, 507.12, 507.13,
507.14, and 507.15. Spaces in which such systems are located shall be considered to be
kitchens and shall be ventilated in accordance with Table 403.3. For the purpose of
determining the floor area required to be ventilated, each individual appliance shall be
considered as occupying not less than 100 square feet (9.3 meters squared).
(C) Net exhaust volumes for hoods shall be permitted to be reduced during part-load
cooking conditions, where engineered or listed multispeed or variable-speed controls
automatically operate the exhaust system to maintain capture and removal of cooking
effluents as required by this section. Reduced volumes shall not be below that required to
maintain capture and removal of effluents from the idle cooking appliances that are
operating in standby mode.
(2) Section 507.2.1 Type | hoods. This section has been modified to add an exception for
installation of Type Il hoods when specific conditions are met. This section has been
modified to read: Type | hoods shall be installed where cooking appliances produce grease or
smoke. Type I hoods shall be installed over medium-duty, heavy-duty, and extra-heavy-duty
cooking appliances. Type | hoods shall be installed over light-duty cooking appliances that
produce grease or smoke. Exception: Type Il hoods shall be permitted to be installed over
medium-duty cooking appliances, ranges and ovens that the code official has determined will
not produce appreciable amounts of grease and/or smoke. Where cooking appliances, ranges
and/or ovens have been approved by the code official for installation under a Type Il hood, a
sign shall be placed on the wall in close proximity to the hood that reads, "Absolutely No
Frying or Grease-Type Cooking Permitted."

[Source: Added at 29 Ok Reg 1659, eff 11-1-12]

748:20-13-10. IMC® 2009 Chapter 6 Duct Systems

Chapter 6 of the IMC® 2009 has been adopted with the following modifications:

(1) Section 603.4 Metallic ducts. The exception to this section has been stricken.

(2) Section 604.1 General. This section was modified to add a requirement to duct insulation
to conform to SMACNA HVAC Duct Construction Standards - Metal and Flexible. This
section has been modified to read: Duct insulation shall conform to the requirements of
Sections 604.2 through 604.13, the International Energy Conservation Code and SMACNA
HVAC Duct Construction Standards - Metal and Flexible.

[Source: Added at 29 Ok Reg 1659, eff 11-1-12]

748:20-13-11. IMC® 2009 Chapter 15 Referenced Standards

Chapter 15 of the IMC® 2009 is adopted with the following modifications:



(1) The reference to the International Building Code® has been modified to include after the
title the words "as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the Uniform
Building Code Commission™. This section has been modified to read: IBC-09 International
Building Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the Uniform
Building Code Commission.

(2) The reference to the International Existing Building Code® has been modified to include
after the title the words "as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the
Uniform Building Code Commission”. This section has been modified to read: IEBC-09
International Existing Building Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma
through the Uniform Building Code Commission.

(3) The reference to the International Energy Conservation Code® has been modified to
include after the title the words "as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma by the
State Fire Marshal until replaced by an adoption done through the Uniform Building Code
Commission"”. This section has been modified to read: IECC-06 International Energy
Conservation Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the State
Fire Marshal until replaced by an adoption done through the Uniform Building Code
Commission.

(4) The reference to the International Fire Code® has been modified to include after the title
the words "as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the Uniform Building
Code Commission™. This section has been modified to read: IMC-09 International Fire
Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the Uniform Building
Code Commission.

(5) The reference to the International Fuel Gas Code® has been modified to include after the
title the words "as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the Uniform
Building Code Commission™. This section has been modified to read: IFGC-09 International
Fuel Gas Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the Uniform
Building Code Commission.

(6) The reference to the International Plumbing Code® has been modified to include after the
title the words "as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the Uniform
Building Code Commission. This section has been modified to read: IPC-09 International
Plumbing Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the Uniform
Building Code Commission.

(7) The reference to the International Residential Code® 2009 has been modified to include
after the title the words "as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the
Uniform Building Code Commission”. This section has been modified to read: IRC-09
International Residential Code® as adopted and modified by the State of Oklahoma through
the Uniform Building Code Commission.

(8) The referenced standard for NFPA 70® National Electrical Code® has been modified to
change the edition year from 2008 to 2011 and include after the title the words "as adopted
and modified by the State of Oklahoma through the Uniform Building Code Commission”.
This section shall now read: 70-11 National Electrical Code® as adopted and modified by the

State of Oklahoma through the Uniform Building Code Commission.
[Source: Added at 31 Ok Reg 2469, eff 9-12-14]



