T T 91 1
y 0215 04:57p Cowart ST TR 9184575462 p

David Timberiake. P.E.

Mary Failin
Chairman

Governor

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:_TFE(_ o« T EC. (0. CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

I.  Submitters Contact Information:
Name: PAVLA LAVEY- CowART Date: </ -30 - lelle
Company: O AP GA< CommISS)100
Address: 41 N, SANTAFE SOiTE C.
City:_ OK ¢ State: DI Zip_ 731194
Phone: QI8 &1 &7 36 Ext: :

Email: D 9@;@114& @ aol.com

2. Do you feel this propesed change will increase the cost of comstruction? [ | Yes )Zj No

Fax:

Which are of the cade needs revision?
Section:_¢23D8R.3.\ #+3 Table: Figure: Page No:ed 3 7

“415.5.14
4. Please check the appropriate box:

L2

[J Revise as follows [] Delete as follows w Add new text as follows [] Delete with substitute

Show the propoesed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

The cait coad nan+rade 1o Fhat Pact of the (‘dtlwa_y yexalosiye o F
Switd~ +racks,, branches, yards, and_tecminals vPoRY Lol
Freans are, boerated. oy Hiretalie. on +rdin on o BoiN.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

De,{r:m‘n oAl ra el will Qla ¢y, Yhe cnde;%ren-%rco_md-
sheiala™dresol b in mare LAFDr Coprlance. aeypes-H,y State

5. Signatre: :
Sekd completed "Public Comment Form" to:

Oklahoma Uniform Building Cod_e_Comga"ssion, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: S or Fax to: 405-521-6504




AP 42

Mary Fallin
Gavernor

David Timberlake, P.E.

¢aRECEIVED

MAY 21 2015 o
Uniform Building Oklahoma Uniform

Code Commission  Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:__IFC Section 2308.8.1.2.6 Signage CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or fitled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form,

}. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Mitchell Hort Date:_. 5/20/15

Company:_City of Yukon

Address:__ 334 Elm Ave

City: Yukon State:_ OK Zip:__ 73099

Phone: (405) 354-6676 Ext: Fax:__ (405) 350-8929
Email: mhort@cityofyukonok.gov

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes []No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section;__2308.8.1.2.6 Table: N/A Figure:__ N/A Page No: 238

4. Please check the appropriate box:
Revise as follows ] Delete as follows [ ] Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

Please see attached

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157

Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




Seciion 2308.8.1.2,6 Sighage
Delete and add the following fext:

Section 2308.8.1.2.6 Signcge. Approved “No Smoking" signs complying with
Section 310 shall be posted as follows:

1. A warning sign(s) shall be posted at the dispensing points with the
following words:

A. STOP MOTOR.

B. NO SMOKING.

C. FLAMMABLE GAS.

D. NATURAL GAS VEHICLE FUEL CYLINDERS SHALL BE INSPECTED AT
INTERVALS NOT EXCEEDING 3 YEARS TO ENSURE SAFE OPERATION OF
THE VEHICLE.

NATURAL GAS FUEL CYLINDERS PAST THEIR END-OF-LIFE DATE SHALL

NOT BE REFUELED AND SHALL BE REMOVED FROM SERVICE.

2. A warning sign with the words "NO SMOKING, FLAMMABLE GAS" shall be
posted in all compressor and storage areas.

3. The location of signs shall be determined by local conditions.

4. The lettering on the sign shall be legible and large enough to be visible
from each poini of fransfer. '

5. The service pressure of each dispenser shall be posted in view of the
operator,

m




AEPICAS
N
Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E.

RECEIVED

o7

JUN 12 2015 15072
Uniform Building ] O,klahoma Umfon,n .
Code Commission Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:__IFC & IFGC CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Terrence Hellman Date:  05/26/2015

Company:__Oklahoma Dept of Labor
Address:___ 3017 N Stiles STE 100

City: Oklahoma City State:_ OK Zip:___ 73105
Phone: 405-613-8658 Ext: Fax:
Email: Terrence.hellman@]labor.ok.gov

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [X] Yes [ No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section: JFC — 2302 & 2308 & IFGC — 201 & 413 Table: Figure: Page No:

4. Please check the appropriate box:
[[] Revise as follows  []| Delete as follows [X] Add new text as follows [[] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

Dispensing Area: the appropriate Hazardous (Classified) Locations for the fuel being dispensed
in accordance with the 2014 Edition of the National Electrical Code - NFPA 70

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

Defining the “Dispensing Area” will clarify multiple references throughout IFC and IFGC.

5. Signature:

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcce.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




AFPTC* g

Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P. E
RECEIVED
AUG 93 2015
Uniform Building Oklahoma Uniform
Code Commission Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:_International Fire Code CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Jeremy Moore Date; July 27. 2015

Company:_FS Circle
Address:__ 2314 West 78" St.

City: Tulsa State:_ Ok Zip:____ 74132
Phone: 918-694-8830 Ext: Fax:
Email: Jeremy@fscircle.org

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ Yes No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:  IFC -2308.4 Table: Figure: Page No:

4. Please check the appropriate box:
[] Revise as follows  [X] Delete as follows [ | Add new text as follows ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

IFC - 2308.4 Private fueling of motor vehicles. Self-service CNG-dispensing systems,
including key, code and card lock dispensing systems, shall be limited to the filling of

permanently mounted fuel containers, en-CNG-powered-vehieles:

In addition to the requirements in section 2305, the owner of a self-service CNG motor fuel-
dispensing faculty shall ensure the safe operation of the system, -and-the-training-ofthe-users:

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

It is common to find CNG trailers utilized in various approved applications throughout the state.
These are commonly filled at CNG fueling stations, but are not a CNG powered vehicle.

The responsibility for a user to be properly trained on their vehicle’s filling procedures should
be the user's and not the fueling station’s owner.

5. Signature: Wa %/ P e
Email to; Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




David Timberlake, P.E.

CEIVED

AUG 21 2015
Uniform Building Oklahoma Umfm m
Code Commission Building Code Commission

Governor

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO 2015 ICC-INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Bach requested change must be on a separate form,

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Ross Barrick Date:_ August 20, 2015

Company:_ OUBCC Alternative Fuel Program Technical Committee
Address:__ 2401 NW 23rd _ Suite 2F

City: Oklahoma City State; _OK Zip: 73107
Phone: 405.521.650!1 "~ Ext: Fax:  405.521.6504
Email;

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ] Yes [ |No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:___ 2303 Table: Figure: Page No:

4. Please checl the appropriate box:
[] Revise as follows [ Delete as foliows [] Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show tlte proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT iu legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text te be added or revised),

(NEW).: 2303.2.1 Permanent lighting shall be provide duting hours of operation, in times of
darkness, at all dispensing devices, required signage, emergency disconnects, and emergency
shutdown controls. The lighting shall be designed to provide illumination such that all
dispensing devices, required signage, emergency disconnect switches and emergency shutdown
controls are visible to the operator.

Supporting information: State purpose and reasoun for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

The illumination requirement would enable to operator to observe the operational controls of the
dispenser device, be able to adequately read the required signage, and readily identify the
required emergency disconnect switches and controls, espeoially the remotely located, or away
from the dispensing area nes The base of this PCF is taken from NTPA® 2-2011 11.2.6 and
11.2.6.1

5. Signature: M&M

Send completed “Publlc Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Bulkllng Cade Commlssmn PO 'Box 12540 Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email fp: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcee.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




gﬁﬁén&el Iakng

<)BW;\;ﬁfﬂlin g
Governor

AUG 212015 @’
Uniform Building Oklahoma Umfm m
Code Commission Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE

FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE

PROPOSED CHANGE TO: 20151CC  INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print cleatly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or fitled ont completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

k.

5. Signature; NB

Submitters Contact Information:

Name: Ross Barrick Date:__Aupust 20, 2015
Company: QUBCC Alternative Fuel Program Technical Committee

Address:_ 2401 NW 234 Suite 2F

City:__Oklahoma City State: OK Zip:___ 73107

Phone: 405.521.6501 Ext: Fax:  405.521.6504
Email: '

Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes []No

Which are of the code needs revision?
Section: 2303 Table: Figure; Page No:___ 229

Please check the appropriate box:
[ 1 Revisc as follows [ Delete as follows [ ] Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

Chapter 23 Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilitics and Repair Garages
Section 2303 Location of Dispensing Devices
2303.1 Location of dispensing devices

ADD NEW: 6.  (Please see attached page)

Supperting information: State purpase and reason {or the change and provide subsiantiation to
support proposed change.

The purpose of this PCF is to incorporate langnage of NFPA® 2-2011 11.3.1.17; NFPA® 30A-
2015 5.6.3 and 12.4; NFPA® 52-2013 7.4,2.2; NFPA® 58-2014 6.25.3.3., for dispensing

devices Jocated under canopies.
This PCF is submitted to summarize the 20| 5 J[CC-IFC Chapter 23 discussipn on canopies, of

the AFPTC, af the July 27, 2015, regularly scheduled meeting,

—"

Send compieted "Puplic Commeni Form" tp:
Oklahoma Uniforim Bul'dmg Cede Commission, PO Bm\ 12540 Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.lehnly@oubee.ok.pov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




2303.1 Location of dispensing devices

6. Where CNG, LNG, LPG, or Hydrogen motor fuel-dispensing devices are installed beneath a
canopy or within an enclosure, either the canopy or enclosure shall be designed to prevent
accumulation or entrapment of ignitable vapors, including provisions for natural or mechanical
ventilation means, or all electrical equipment installed beneath the canopy or withln the
enclosure shall be suitable for Class 1, Division2 hazardous (classified) locations. Tank vents -
that are instafled within or attached to the canopy or enclosure shall extend a minimum of 5
feet (1.5m) above the highest projection of the canopy. Compression and storage equipment
located on top of the motor fuel-dispensing facility canopies shall be in accordance with the
current State of Oklahoma adopted International Fire Code® Section 2309 and International
Building Code® Section 406.

References:
s NFPA® 2-2011 11.3.1.17 LH2 Dispenser Installation Beneath Canoples
o  NFPA® 30A-2015 5.6.3 Vent Piping
12.4 Dispenser Installation Beneath Canoples
» NFPA®52-2013 7.4.2,2 CNG Dispensing Systems-Outdoors
o NFPA®58-2014 6.253.3 LPG Vehicle Fuel Dispensers & Dispensing Statlons
s  NFPA® 70-2014 500.5 Classification of Locations

WY

Ross Barrick
August 20, 2015




David Timberlake, P.E.
Chairman

Mary Fallin
Governor

N

Oklahoma Uniform
Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO: International Fire Code-2015 CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

l. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: OUBCC Alternative Fuels Program Technical Committee Date:__October 22, 2015

Company:_ Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission

Address: 2401 NW 23" St. Suite 2F

City: Oklahoma City State:_ OK Zip:___ 73107
Phone; 405-521-6501 Ext: Fax:__ 405-521-6504
Email:

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? P Yes []No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:___2304.3.7 Table: Figure: Page No:___ 230

4. Please check the appropriate box:
[ ] Revise as follows [ ] Delete as follows Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

2304.3.7 Quantity limits. Dispensing equipment used at unsupervised locations shall comply with one of the
following:
1. Dispensing devices shall be programmed or set to limit uninterrupted fuel delivery to 25 gallons (95L) and
require a manual action to resume delivery.

Exception: Dispensing devices equipped with a listed breakaway device or equal approved by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction. Such emergency breakaway device shall be installed, maintained, and replaced in accordance
with the manufacturer’s instructions.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

This PCF is submitted to collate the discussion of the Committee during the 09/21/2015 meeting. The discussion
related to the filling of large fleet vehicles, “tank trailers” of large capacities, and the fill-time duration, The 25
gallon delivery limit was determined to be impracticable in these types of dispensing applications.

(NFPA 30A-14 6.5.2)

5. Signature: Ross Barrick, AFPTC Commission [ iaison

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly{@oubce.ok.goy or Fax to: 405-521-6504




David Timberlake, P.E. :
Chairman

Mary Fallin
Governor

AFTC - 1D

Oklahoma Uniform
Building Code Commission
PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE

FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO: IFC iRl CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Flease type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form,

1. Submitters Contact Information;

Name: Adam Shupe Date: L1/6/15
Company: AFPTC Committee

Address:

City: State: Zip:

Phone: : Ext: Fax:

Email:

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes [ ]No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section&m__ai Table: Figure: Page No: @
4. Please check %%l?ﬁé)ﬁl@é h,nx:

] Revise as follows [ ] Delete as follows [ | Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substituie

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

See Attached

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change,

5. Signature: AFPTC Committee

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly(@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




2303.2 Emergency disconnect switches, An approved, clearly identified and readily accessible
emergency disconnect switch shall be provided at an approved location to stop the transfer of fuel to
the fuel to the fuel dispensers in the event of a fuel spill or other emergency. The emergency disconnect
switch for exterior fuel dispensers shall be located within 100 feet (30 480 mm) of, but not less than 20
feet (6096 mm) from, the fuel dispensers. For interior fuel-dispensing operations, the emergency
disconnect switch shall be installed at an approved location. Such devices shall be distinctly labefed as:
EMERGENCY FUEL SHUTOFF. Signs shall be provided in approved locations.

2303.2.1 Local emergency disconnect switches. A local emergency disconnect switch, whether required
or not, located within 20 feet of any dispensing unit shall be interlocked with all other dispensing units
of the same fuel type. In addition, all dispensing devices of various fuel types within 20 feet of a local
emergency disconnect shall be interlocked.




David Timberlake, P.E.
Chairman

Mary Fallin
Governor

Neote -\ |

e 'I,- £5
Oklahoma Uniform
Building Code Commission
PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE

FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO: 1FC ssllioge CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:

Name; Adam Shupe Date: 11/6/15
Company: AFPTC Committee

Address:

City: State: Zip:

Phone: Ext: Fax:

Email:

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes [ ]No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?

SectnonQﬁQg__g_r Table Figure: Page No: é@g

[] Revise as follows  [_] Delete as follows [] Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

4. Please checgt'he appr Opl 1ate box

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

See Aitached

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

5. Signature: AFPTC Committee

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubce.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




2308.7 Emergency shutdown eentrel-devices. Ar-A remote and local emergency manual shutdown

eontrol device dewce shali be_provided leeatedw&huﬂ%—ﬁeet—%%@-wﬂef—bupnwess-ﬁm—gﬁepﬁsze

area. Upon activation, the
emergency shutdown system shall automatlcally 5hut—e£f—thepewer—5upply—te—the—ee{messer—and close
valves between the main gas supply and the compressor and between the storage containers and
dispensers_ and automatically shut off the power supply to the compressor and the following associated
devices: dispensing devices; remote pumps; power, control, and signal circuits; and electrical equipment
in the hazardous {classified) locations surrounding the fuel dispensing devices. All labeled emergency
shutdown devices shall be interconnected, whether required or not. Resetting from an emergency
shutoff condition shall require manual intervention and the manner of resetting shall be approved by
the authority having jurisdiction,

2308.7.1 Remote emergency shutdown device. A remote emergency manual shutdown device shall be
located within 100 feet (30 480 mm) of, but not less than 20 feet (6096 mm) from, all dispensers and
shall be provided in the compressor area.

Exception: A remote emergency manual shutdown device may be located greater than 100 feet
from one or more dispensers when within line of site of the dispensers and approved by the
authority having jurisdiction.

2308.7.2 Local emergency shutdown device. A local emergency manual shutdown device shall be
located within 10 feet {3048 mm) of each dispensing device,




AEPTC* 19

Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E.

RECGEIVED

Suilding Oklahoma Uniform
iform Bui v o
C%rgcfao&mmission Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO: IFC 2015 CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:

Name: Adam Shupe Date: 1/25/16
Company: AFPTC

Address: 2401 NW 23" St., Suite 2F

City: OKC State:_ OK Zip:__ 73102
Phone: 405-521-6501 Ext: Fax:

Email:

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ |Yes [ ]No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:___ 2301.7 Table: Figure: Page No: 0/%5?9

4. Please check the appropriate box:
[] Revise as follows  [] Delete as follows X Add new text as follows [_] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

2301.7 Liquid Natural Gas Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities. Motor fuel-dispensing facilities
utilizing liquid natural gas (LNG) fuel shall comply with the requirements of Section 2303 and
Chapter 55.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

Written in response to committee discussion from the November 16, 2016 meeting

5. Signature: Adam Shupe

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




APTC # 12

Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E.

RECEIVED

\J/\N Q [ ”’}1(3 3 1907
: L Oklahoma Uniform
Uniform Building

Code Commission Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO: IFC 2015 CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:

Name: Adam Shupe Date: 1/25/16
Company: AFPTC

Address: 2401 NW 23" St., Suite 2F

City: OKC State:__OK Zip:____ 73102
Phone: 405-521-6501 Ext: Fax:

Email:

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes []No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:___ 5501.1 Table: Figure: Page No 356

4. Please check the appropriate box:
[] Revise as follows  [_] Delete as follows X Add new text as follows [_] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

5501.1 Scope. Storage, use and handling of cryogenic fluids shall comply with this chapter and
NFPA 55. Cryogenic fluids classified as hazardous materials shall also comply with the general
requirements of Chapter 50. Partially full containers containing residual cryogenic fluids shall
be considered as full for the purposes of the controls required.

Exceptions:

1. Fluids used as refrigerants in refrigeration systems (see Section 606).

2. Liquefied natural gas (LNG), which shall comply with Chapter 23 and NEPA-59A 52,
Chapters 10, 12, and 13.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

Written in response to committee discussion from the November 16, 2016 meeting

5. Signature: Adam Shupe

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcce.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




David Timberlake, P.E.

chaimRECEIVED

FEB. 222016
Uniform Building ) O.klahoma Unlforl.n )
Code Commission  Building Code Commission

Mary Fallin
Governor

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO: IFC CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Paula Laney Date: 2/15/2016

Company:_ OK LP Gas Research, Marketing, & Safety Commission
Address:___ 6412 N Santa Fe, Suite C

City: OKC State:_ OK Zip:____ 73116
Phone: 918-261-6736 Ext: Fax:
Email: okgaschick@gmail.com

2. Do you feel this proposed éhange will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes X[ ]No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section: 2307.3 & 6106.1 Table: Figure: Page No:___ 236 & 439

4. Please check the appropriate box:
X[] Revise as follows [_] Delete as follows [ ] Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).,

Section 2307.3. Attendants. Motor fuel-dispensing operations for LP-gas shall be conducted by
qualified attendants or in accordance with Section 2307.6 by persons trained in the proper
handling of LP-gas. When the dispensing equipment meets the guidelines of NFPA 58 for "Low
Emission Transfer" an attendant is not required per this section.

Section 6106.1 Attendants. Dispensing of LP-gas shall be performed by a qualified attendant.
When the dispensing equipment meets the guidelines of NFPA 58 for "Low Emission Transfer"
an attendant is not required per this section.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

Low emission transfer LP Gas dispensers are intended for consumer use like CNG refueling
stations. This should only be allowed for those meeting this standard. Traditional style LP
dispensers would not be included.

5. Signature: Paula Laney-Cowart

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




AEOTE 4 A

Dayid Timberlake, P.E. Mary Fallin
C&E@ E l VE D Governor
FEB 222016
Uniform Building Oklahoma Uniform
Code Commission Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO: IFC CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

L.

Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Paula Laney Date:  2/15/2016

Company:_ OK LP Gas Research, Marketing, & Safety Commission
Address:___ 6412 N Santa Fe, Suite C

City: OKC State:_ OK Zip:___ 73116
Phone: 918-261-6736 Ext: Fax:
Email: okgaschick@gmail.com

Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes X[ |No

Which are of the code needs revision?
Section: 2307.4 1 Table: Figure: Page No:

Please check the appropriate box:
X[ ] Revise as follows [ ] Delete as follows [_] Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).



Section 2307.4 Location of dispensing operations and equipment. The point of transfer for
LP-gas dispensing operations shall be separated from buildings and other exposures in
accordance with the following:

1. Not less than 25 feet (7620 mm) from buildings where the exterior wall is not part of the fire-
resistance-rated assembly having a rating of 1 hour or greater.

2. Not less than 25 feet (7620 mm) from combustible overhangs on buildings, measured from a
vertical line dropped from the face of the overhang at a point nearest the point of transfer.

3. Not less than 25 feet (7620 mm) from the lot line of the property that can be built upon.

4. Not less than 25 feet (7620 mm) from the centerline of the nearest mainline railroad track.

5. Not less than 10 feet (3048 mm) from public streets, highways, thoroughfares, sidewalks and
driveways.

6. Not less than 10 feet (3048 mm) from buildings where the exterior wall is part of a fire-
resistance-rated assembly having a rating of 1 hour or greater.

Exception: When the dispensing equipment meets the guidelines of NFPA 58, Section 6.28.5

for "Low Emission Transfer" Section 6.28.6 the transfer distance requirements shall be reduced
by one-half.

Exception: The point of transfer for LP-gas dispensing operations need not be separated from
canopies that are constructed in accordance with the International Building Code and that
provide weather protection for the dispensing equipment.

LP-gas containers shall be located in accordance with Chapter 61. LP-gas storage and
dispensing equipment shall be located outdoors.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to -
support proposed change.

Low emission transfer LP Gas dispensers are relatively new and there is currently no provision
for them in the IFC. This language comes directly from NFPA 58.

Signature: Paula Laney-Cowart

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




W}HQ (Rouadt

Dayid Timberlake, P.E. Mary Fallin
Cﬁ EIVED Governor
MAR 18 2016
Uniform Building
Code Commission Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO: IFC CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name:_Paula Laney Date: 2-15-2016

Company:OK LP Gas Research, Marketing, & Safety Commission

Address; 6412 N. Santa Fe, Suite C

---—City:-OKC._ . : e State:-OK. - - Zip:_-73116

Phone: 91.8-261-6736 Ext: Fax:

Email: okgaschick@gmail .com

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ | Yes [x] No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:_ 2307.7 #3 Table: Figure: Page No:

4. Please check the appropriate box:

[X] Revise as follows [ ] Delete as follows [ Add new text as follows [] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to

be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

3. The owner of the LP-gas motor fuel-dispensing facility or the owner's designee shall provide for the s
of the system and the training of users.
Exception. If the LP-gas motor fuel-dispensing facility meets the requirements of a low emission transfer
NFPA 58, then training of users is not the responsibility of the facility.

fe operation

station per

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

As was discussed with CNG refueling, it is impractical and unenforceable to require the owner to provide
generalized training to consumers. This would only apply to a low emission transfer station, as traditiona
are operated by a licensed LP gas person.

for
dispensers

5. Signature: Paula Laney-Cowart

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehniy@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




NewEaly

Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E.

“RECEIVED

FEB.
v20 Oklahoma Uniform

Uniform Buildin OF [ o
Code Commissign Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO: IFC CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

I. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Paula Laney Date: 2-15-2016

Company:OK LP Gas Research, Marketing, & Safety Commission
Address; 6412 N. Santa Fe, Suite C

City:_ OKC State: OK Zip:__73116
Phone: 918-261-6736 Ext: Fax:

Email:_okgaschick@gmail.com

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [JYes [xNo

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:_6106.2 Table: Figure: Page No:

4. Please check the appropriate box:
Revise as follows  [_] Delete as follows [] Add new text as follows [] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

Overfilling. LP-gas containers shall not be filled or maintained with LP-gas in excess of either the volume]determined
using the fixed liquid-level gauge installed in accordance with the manufacturer's specifications and in acgordance with
Section 5.7.5 of NFPA58, the volume determined by the overfilling prevention device installed on the confainer, or the
weight determined by the percentage of the water capacity marked on the container.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change,

The over filling protection device is the method used to determine the proper volume at a low emision transfer station.
There is an exception in NFPA 58 11.4.1.16 and 17 regarding this exception to using the fixed maximum |evel gauge
and IFC section 2307.8 actually has the OPD listed.

5. Signature; Paula Laney-Cowart

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




NPTC- 1R

Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E.

crE=CEIVED

JUL 212016
Uniform Building Oklahoma Uniform
Code Commission Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:__ 2015 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Adam Shupe Date:_ 7/20/16

Company:_ Burns & McDonnell (for address only)

Address:___ 615 N Hudson, Suite 200

City: Oklahoma City State:__OK Zip:_ 73102
Phone: (405) 200-0306 Ext: Fax:___(405) 568-4339
Email: ashupe@burnsmed.com

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes [X]No

3. Which are of the code needs revision? L&
Section:___ 502.15 Table: Figure: Page No:

4. Please check the appropriate box:
[ ] Revise as follows [ ] Delete as follows [X] Add new text as follows [ | Delete with substitute

Show the propesed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

[F] 502.15 Repair garages.

Where Class I liquids or LP-gas are stored or used within a building having a basement or pit wherein
flammable vapors could accumulate, the basement or pit shall be provided with ventilation designed_in
accordance with 2311.4.3 of the International Fire Code to prevent the accumulation of flammable vapors
therein.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

This change modifies the IMC to refer to the IFC for additional ventilation requirements.

5. Signature: /44"’ %a/
[

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




BT *19

David Timberlake, P.E. Mary Fallin
Chairman Governor
RECEIVED
JUL 212016
Uniform Building Building Code Commission

Code Commission
PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:_ 2015 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Adam Shupe Date: 7/20/16

Company:_Burmns & McDonnell (for address only)

Address:___ 615 N Hudson, Suite 200

City: Oklahoma City State:___OK Zip:___ 73102
Phone: (405) 200-0306 Ext: Fax:_ (405) 568-4339
Email: ashupe@burnsmcd.com

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ] Yes [X]No

3. Which are of the code needs revision? 4%
Section:___ 502.16.1 Table: Figure: Page No:

4. Please check the appropriate box: »
X Revise as follows  [_] Delete as follows [ ] Add new text as follows [_] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

See next page.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and proyide substantiation to
support proposed change.

This change modifies the IMC to align with the NEC.

5. Signature: 44"—%’(‘?“/'
<7

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




[F] 502.16 Repair garages for natural gas and hydrogen fueled vehicles.

Repair garages used for the repair of natural gas or hydrogen-fueled vehicles shall be provided with an approved
mechanical ventilation system. The mechanical ventilation system shall be in accordance with Sections 502.16.1
and 502.16.2.

Exception: Where approved by the code official, natural ventilation shall be permitted in lieu of mechanical
ventilation.

[F] 502.16.1 Design.

Indoor locations shall be ventilated utilizing air supply inlets and exhaust outlets arranged to provide
uniform air movement to the extent practical. Inlets shall be uniformly arranged on exterior walls near floor
level. Outlets shall be located a+ within 18 inches (457 mm) of the high point of the room in exterior walls
or the roof.

Ventilation shall be by a continuous mechanical ventilation system or by a mechanical ventilation
system activated by a continuously monitoring natural gas detection system, or for hydrogen, a continuously
monitoring flammable gas detection system, each activating at a gas concentration of 25 percent of the lower
flammable limit (LFL). In all cases, the system shall shut down the fueling system in the event of failure of
the ventilation system.

The ventilation rate shall be not less than 1 cubic foot per minute per 12 cubic feet [0.00138 m3/(s
m3)] of room volume.

[F] 502.16.2 Operation.
The mechanical ventilation system shall operate continuously.

Exceptions:

1. Mechanical ventilation systems that are interlocked with a gas detection system designed in
accordance with the International Fire Code.

2. Mechanical ventilation systems in garages that are used only for the repair of vehicles fueled by
liquid fuels or odorized gases, such as CNG, where the ventilation system is electrically
interlocked with the lighting circuit.




AF@T QﬁaG

[RE’@EQME@ Mary Fallin
Chairman Governor
JUL 212018
Uniform Building Oklahoma Uniform

Code Commission
Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:__2015 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Adam Shupe Date:_ 7/20/16

Company:_ Burns & McDonnell (for address only)
Address:___ 615 N Hudson, Suite 200

City: Oklahoma City State:_ OK Zip:____ 73102
Phone;: (405) 200-0306 Ext: Fax:__ (405) 568-4339
Email: ashupe(@burnsmcd.com

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes [X]No

3. Which are of the code needs revision? Lﬁg
Section:__ 502.16.1 Table: Figure: Page No:

4. Please check the appropriate box:
Xl Revise as follows  [_] Delete as follows [_| Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

See next page.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

This change modifies the IMC to align with the NEC.

5. Signature: %W’
[

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




[F] 502.16 Repair garages for natural gas and hydrogen fueled vehicles.

Repair garages used for the repair of natural gas or hydrogen-fueled vehicles shall be provided with an approved
mechanical ventilation system. The mechanical ventilation system shall be in accordance with Sections 502.16.1
and 502.16.2.

Exception: Where approved by the code official, natural ventilation shall be permitted in lieu of mechanical
ventilation.

[F] 502.16.1 Design.

Indoor locations shall be ventilated utilizing air supply inlets and exhaust outlets arranged to provide
uniform air movement to the extent practical. Inlets shall be uniformly arranged on exterior walls near floor
level. Outlets shall be located at the high point of the room in exterior walls or the roof.

Ventilation shall be by a continuous mechanical ventilation system or by a mechanical ventilation
system activated by a continuously monitoring natural gas detection system, or for hydrogen, a continuously
monitoring flammable gas detection system, each activating at a gas concentration of 25 percent of the lower
flammable limit (LFL). In all cases, the system shall shut down the fueling system in the event of failure of
the ventilation system.

The ventilation rate shall be not less than 1 cubic foot per minute per-t2-eubiefeet square foot [0-00138
0.0051 m3/(s » m32)] of room-vekume area.

[F] 502.16.2 Operation.
The mechanical ventilation system shall operate continuously.

Exceptions:

1. Mechanical ventilation systems that are interlocked with a gas detection system designed in
accordance with the International Fire Code.

2. Mechanical ventilation systems in garages that are used only for the repair of vehicles fueled by
liquid fuels or odorized gases, such as CNG, where the ventilation system is electrically
interlocked with the lighting circuit.




APTC-Aal

RECEIVED

ry

JUL GU95

David Timberlake, P.E.
Chairman

- Uniform Building
Oklahoma Uniform Code Commission

Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:__2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Adam Shupe ’ Date:_ 7/20/16

Company:_ Burns & McDonnell (for address only)
Address:__ 615 N Hudson, Suite 200

City: Oklahoma City State:_ OK Zip:____73102
Phone: (405) 200-0306 Ext: Fax:  (405) 568-4339
Email: ashupe@bumsmcd.com

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [(lYes X No

3. Which are of the code needs revision? (94\5
Section:___ 2311.4.3 Table: Figure: Page No:

4. Please check the appropriate box:

[] Revise as follows  [_]| Delete as follows [X] Add new text as follows [ | Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

2311.4.3 Ventilation. Where Class I liquids or LP-gas are stored or used within a building having a
basement or pit wherein flammable vapors could accumulate, the basement or pit shall be provided with
mechanical ventilation in accordance with the International Mechanical Code, at a minimum rate of 1 4
cubic feet per minute per square foot (cfm/ft*2) [0.008m"3/(s * m”2)] taken from a point within 12
inches (305 mm) of the floor to prevent accumulation of flammable vapors.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

This change modifies the IFC to align with the NEC in regards to the point at which mechanical
ventilation should be exhausted.

5. Signature: MW
< ST

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubce.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




David Timberlake, P.E.

cRECEIVED

JUL 212016
Uniform Building . O.klahoma Uniform .
Code Commission Building Code Commission

Mary Fallin
Governor

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:__2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Adam Shupe Date:_ 7/20/16

Company:_ Burns & McDonnell (for address only)
Address;_ 615 N Hudson, Suite 200

City: Oklahoma City ~State:__OK Zip:___73102
Phone: (405) 200-0306 Ext: Fax: (405) 568-4339
Email: ashupe@burnsmcd.com

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes [X]No

3. Which are of the code needs revision? %
Section:____2311.5 Table: Figure: Page No:_/

4. Please check the appropriate box:

[] Revise as follows [ Delete as follows [X] Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

See next page.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

Additional safety measures added to ensure that the pressure of the CNG and LNG tank does not increase
over time while the vehicle is parked in the garage.

5. Signature: 44""* %”'
7

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubce.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




2311.5 Preparation of vehicles for repair. For vehicles powered by gaseous fuels, the fuel shutoff valves shall
be closed prior to repairing any portion of the vehicle fuel system. Vehicles powered by gaseous fuels in which
the fuel system has been damaged shall be inspected and evaluated for fuel system integrity prior to being
brought into the repair garage. The inspection shall include testing of the entire fuel delivery system for leakage.

Liquefied Natural Gas (LNG) vehicles and Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) vehicles shall comply with Sections
2311.5.1 and 2311.5.2, as applicable.

2311.5.1 Liquefied Natural Gas (LNG). Liquefied Natural Gas (LNG) vehicle fuel system pressure shall be
measured and recorded prior to entering the repair facility and at least every third day the vehicle remains in the
building. Records shall be posted on the windshield of the vehicle. The maximum allowable system pressure
shall be no more than 170 psig. Pressure above 170 psig shall be reduced by operating the vehicle, or limited
venting outdoors as required.

2311.5.2 Compressed Natural Gas (CNG). Compressed Natural Gas (CNG) vehicle fuel system pressure and

the ambient temperature shall be measured and recorded prior to entering the repair facility. Pressure above the
indicated maximum pressure in accordance with Table 2311.5.2 shall be reduced by defueling the vehicle.




Dayjd Timberlake, P.E. Mary Fa

C 1C E IVE D Governor
JUL 212016
Uniform Building Oklahoma Uniform
Code Commission Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:__2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Adam Shupe Date:___7/20/16

Company:_ Burns & McDonnell (for address only)
Address:___ 615 N Hudson, Suite 200

City: Oklahoma City State:_ OK Zip:__ 73102
Phone: (405) 200-0306 Ext: Fax: _ (405) 568-4339
Email: ashupe@burnsmcd.com

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes [X]No

3. Which are of the code needs revision? 4
Section:___ 2311.7 Table: Figure: Page No: H %

4. Please check the appropriate box:

[] Revise as follows [ ] Delete as follows [X] Add new text as follows [_] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

See next page.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

An exception is added for CNG or LNG fueled vehicles that are purged of their fuel.

5. Signature; 4&"%"/’
[

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




2311.7 Repair garages for vehicles fueled by lighter-than-air fuels. Repair garages for the conversion and
repair of vehicles that use CNG, liquefied natural gas (LNG), hydrogen or other lighter-than-air motor fuels shall
be in accordance with Sections 2311.7 through 2311.7.2.3 in addition to the other requirements of Section 2311.

Exceptions:

1. Repair garages where work is conducted only on vehicles that have been defueled and their systems
purged with nitrogen gas, and where standard operating procedures to document and maintain the
fueling status throughout repair operations are approved.

2. Repair garages where work is not performed on the fuel system and is limited to exchange of parts
and maintenance not requiring open flame or welding on the CNG-, LNG-, hydrogen- or other
lighter-than-air-fueled motor vehicle.

3. Repair garages for hydrogen-fueled vehicles where work is not performed on the hydrogen storage
tank and is limited to the exchange of parts and maintenance not requiring open flame or welding on
the hydrogen-fueled vehicle. During the work, the entire hydrogen fuel system shall contain a
quantity that is less than 200 cubic feet (5.6 m3) of hydrogen.




P4

Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E.
Chairma
RECEIVED
JUL 212016

Uniform Building Building Code Commission
Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:__2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Adam Shupe Date:_ 7/20/16

Company:_ Burns & McDonnell (for address only)

Address:_ 615 N Hudson, Suite 200

City: Oklahoma City State:_ OK Zip:___ 73102
Phone: (405) 200-0306 Ext: Fax:__ (405) 568-4339
Email: ashupe@burnsmed.com

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes [XNo

3. Which are of the code needs revision? &JV
Section:___2311.7.1.1 Table: Figure: Page No: %

4. Please check the appropriate box:
X Revise as follows [ Delete as follows [ ] Add new text as follows [_] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

See the following pages.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

This change modifies the IFC to align with the NEC.

5. Signature: /44"‘%“/'
[

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




2311.7 Repair garages for vehicles fueled by lighter-than-air fuels.

Repair garages for the conversion and repair of vehicles that use CNG, liquefied natural gas (LNG), hydrogen or
other lighter-than-air motor fuels shall be in accordance with Sections 2311.7 through 2311.7.2.3 in addition to
the other requirements of Section 2311.

Exceptions:

1. Repair garages where work is not performed on the fuel system and is limited to exchange of parts
and maintenance not requiring open flame or welding on the CNG-, LNG-, hydrogen- or other
lighter-than-air-fueled motor vehicle.

2. Repair garages for hydrogen-fueled vehicles where work is not performed on the hydrogen storage
tank and is limited to the exchange of parts and maintenance not requiring open flame or welding on
the hydrogen-fueled vehicle. During the work, the entire hydrogen fuel system shall contain a
quantity that is less than 200 cubic feet (5.6 m3) of hydrogen.

2311.7.1 Ventilation.

Repair garages used for the repair of natural gas- or hydrogen-fueled vehicles shall be provided with an
approved mechanical ventilation system. The mechanical ventilation system shall be in accordance with the
International Mechanical Code and Sections 2311.7.1.1 and 2311.7.1.2.

Exception: Repair garages with natural ventilation when approved.

2311.7.1.1 Design.

Indoor locations shall be ventilated utilizing air supply inlets and exhaust outlets arranged to provide
uniform air movement to the extent practical. Inlets shall be uniformly arranged on exterior walls near
floor level. Outlets shall be located at the high point of the room in exterior walls or the roof.

Ventilation shall be by a continuous mechanical ventilation system or by a mechanical
ventilation system activated by a continuously monitoring natural gas detection system or, for hydrogen,
a continuously monitoring flammable gas detection system, each activating at a gas concentration of not
more than 25 percent of the lower flammable limit (LFL). In all cases, the system shall shut down the
fueling system in the event of failure of the ventilation system.

The ventilation rate shall be not less than 1 cubic foot per minute per32-eubiefeet square foot
[6-60438 0.0051 m3/(s * m32)] of room-vehune area.

2311.7.1.2 Operation.
The mechanical ventilation system shall operate continuously.

Exceptions:

1. Mechanical ventilation systems that are interlocked with a gas detection system
designed in accordance with Sections 2311.7.2 through 2311.7.2.3.

2. Mechanical ventilation systems in repair garages that are used only for repair of vehicles
fueled by liquid fuels or odorized gases, such as CNG, where the ventilation system is
electrically interlocked with the lighting circuit.

2311.7.2 Gas detection system.
Repair garages used for repair of vehicles fueled by nonodorized gases including, but not limited to,
hydrogen and nonodorized LNG, shall be provided with a flammable gas detection system.



2311.7.2.1 System design.

The flammable gas detection system shall be listed or approved and shall be calibrated to the types of
fuels or gases used by vehicles to be repaired. The gas detection system shall be designed to activate
when the level of flammable gas exceeds 25 percent of the lower flammable limit (LFL). Gas detection
shall be provided in lubrication or chassis service pits of repair garages used for repairing nonodorized
LNG-fueled vehicles.

2311.7.2.1.1 Gas detection system components.

Gas detection system control units shall be listed and labeled in accordance with UL 864 or UL
2017. Gas detectors shall be listed and labeled in accordance with UL 2075 for use with the
gases and vapors being detected.

2311.7.2.2 Operation.
Activation of the gas detection system shall result in all the following:

1. Initiation of distinct audible and visual alarm signals in the repair garage.
2. Deactivation of all heating systems located in the repair garage.

3. Activation of the mechanical ventilation system, where the system is interlocked with gas
detection.

2311.7.2.3 Failure of the gas detection system.

Failure of the gas detection system shall result in the deactivation of the heating system, activation of the
mechanical ventilation system where the system is interlocked with the gas detection system and cause a
trouble signal to sound in an approved location.



AHETCLH* O

Mary Fallin

David Timberlake, P.E.
Governor

““RECEIVED

JUL 222016 &
. . Oklahoma Uniform
C‘é‘&'fgg,,'?,‘,’,'};"s?gn Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO: NFPA® 70 National Electrical Code® 2014 . CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name:_OUBCC Alternative Fuels Program Technical Committee Date: July 22,2016

Company:__Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission
Address:__ 2401 NW 23 St. Suite 2F

City: Oklahoma City State: OK Zip:___73107
Phone: 405-521-6501 Ext: Fax:__ 405-521-6504
Email:

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ | Yes [X]No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:____511.2 Table: Figure: Page No___ 437

4. Please check the appropriate box:
[] Revise as follows  [_| Delete as follows Add new text as follows [_| Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

511.2 Definitions
Major Repair Garage. A building or portions of a building where major repairs, such as enginé overhauls,

painting, body and fender work, maintenance or repairs that require open-flame cutting or welding, and repairs that

require draining of the motor vehicle fuel tank are performed on motor vehicles, including associated floor space
used for offices, parking, or showrooms

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

The added text further defines types of work being performed to better able the classification of an area.

Source: NFPA® 2 Hydrogen Technologies Code 2016 Edition 3.3.101.1 Major Repair Garage.

~ O\

5. Signature; Ross Barrick, AFPTC Commission Liaison

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




REGEIVED

Mary Fallin
Chai{ﬂ}ﬁ? 25 2016 Governor
Uniform Building -’
Code Commission OKlahoma Uniform

Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO: INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:

Name: Eric Pollard Date:__7/2//2016
Company: Association of Central Oklahoma Governments (ACOG)

Address;__ 21 E. Main St., Ste. 100

City: Oklahoma City State:_ OK Zip:___ 73104
Phone: 405-778-6175 Ext: Fax:

Email: epollard@acogok.org

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ] Yes [X] No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:___ 2209 Table: Figure: Page No:

4. Please check the appropriate box:
D Revise as follows  [] Delete as follows [ ] Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

References to NFPA 2 2011 edition revised to reference 2016 edition

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

Proposed change recommended by hydrogen fueling industry experts as improvements were
made to latest edition of NFPA 2 (2016) from the most recent prior edition (2011)

5. Signature: % / W

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




YOV CA0

Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberl P.E.
REGHIVED

AUG 302016 g
Uniform Building 'O'klahoma UnlfOl‘{n .
Code Commission Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE »
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:; International Building Code CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: Adam Shupe Date: 8/30/16

Company: AFPTC Commitiee
Address:

City: ' State: Zip:
Phone: Ext: EEEEE—— Fax.
Email; —

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? []Yes []No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section; 406.7.2.1 Table: Figure: Page No: 65

4. Please check the appropriate box:
[ Revise as follows [ ] Delete as follows [ ] Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

406.7.2.1 Canoples used to support lighter-than-air gaseous hydregen systems. Canoples that are used to shelter dispensing operations
where flammable compressed gases are localed on the roof of the canopy shall be in accordance with the following:

The canopy shall meet or exceed Type | construction requirements.
Operations localed under canopies shall be limited to refueling only.
The canopy shall be constructed In a manner that prevents the accumulation of hydrogen gas.

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

The proposed change came out of the discussion held during the final review of the
presentation. The section should address more than hydrogen gas and should apply to
all lighter-than-air gases.

5. Signature: 44"’-%’{“7"/'
T

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




David Timberlake, P.E. Mary Fallin
REE‘VED Governor
AUG 302016
Uniform Building Oklahoma Uniform
Code Commission Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES FOR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL PROGRAM TECHNICAL COMMITTEE
PROPOSED CHANGE TO:; Intemational Bullding Code CODE

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form. '

1.

5.

Submitters Contact Information:

Name: Adam Shupe Date: 8/30/16
Company: AFPTC Committee

Address:

City: State: - Zip:
Phone: Ext: Fax:
Email:

Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? []Yes []No

Which are of the code needs revision? .
Section; 406.7.2.2 Table: Figure: _ Page No: 65

Please check the appropriate box:
[J Revise as follows  [] Delete as follows [M] Add new text as follows [_] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

406.7.2.2 Canoples sheltering dispensing devices dispensing lighter-than-air gas. Where CNG, LNG, LPG, or Hydrogen motor fuel
dispensing devices are Installed beneath a canopy, the canopy shall be designed lo prevent the accumulation or entrapment of igniiable
vapors, including provisions for natural or mechanical venlilation means, or all electrical equipment installed beneath the canopy or within the
enclosure shall be suitable for Class 1. Division 2 h: dous {clagsifi ocations, Tank vents that are Installed witl tac tothe
canopy® shall extend a minimum of 5 feet (1624 mm) above the highest projection of the canopy. Compression and storage equipment
localed on the lop of the canopy shall be in accordance with current Slale of Oklahoma adopted Internalional Fire Code®, Seclion 2309,

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and pro‘vide substantiation to
support proposed change.

LLanguage should be added to the IBC similar to the language that AFPTC #8 will add
to theIFC so that anyone designing a canopy will have the same requirements.

Signature: %‘—%’V
7

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Kathy.Hehnly@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504



128139
Cross-Out


	AFPTC 1
	AFPTC 2
	AFPTC 5
	AFPTC 6
	AFPTC 7
	AFPTC 8
	AFPTC 9
	AFPTC 10
	AFPTC 11
	AFPTC 12
	AFPTC 13
	AFPTC 14
	AFPTC 15
	AFPTC 16 Revised
	AFPTC 17
	AFPTC 18
	AFPTC 19
	AFPTC 20
	AFPTC 21
	AFPTC 22
	AFPTC 23
	AFPTC 24
	AFPTC 25
	AFPTC 26
	AFPTC 27
	AFPTC 28 revised

