B-&

Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E.
Chairman

Oklahoma Uniform
Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE ADOPTION OF BUILDING/CONSTRUCTION CODES -
PROPOSED CHANGE TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

INSTRUCTIONS; Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out
completely, may not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

l. Submiiters Contaetl Information:

Name: Greg Clark Date: 4/27/15
Company; Cily of Norman

Address: 2315 Lindenwood

City: Nortnan State:__OK Zip: 73071
Plione: 4055882785 Ext: Fax;

Email: gelark76@gmail.com

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ]Yes X[ [No

3. Which are of the code needs vevision?
Section:___ R326 Table: Figure; Page No:

4. Please check the appropriate box:
X Reviscasfollows {] Delete as follows [] Add new text as follows [ Defete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED', OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through fext to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised),

See altached.

Supporting informnation: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation fe
support proposed change,

As historically there has been no adopted standard for Swimming Pool Baryiers in the state and
it appears likely the new section 326 will not be adopled the following is a reasonable
alternative, The revised requirements are generally consistent with many Home Owners
Insurance providess. These standards are also largely consistent with the IBC for Public Pools
and provide for entrapment avoidance for installers.




Seiid completed "Public Comment Form" to:

Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Shawnta.Mitchell@oubcc.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504

5. Signature:_.

SECTION R324
SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS

R326.1 General, ‘The-designand-construction-of aquatic-vessels-shall-eomply-with-the Internati
Pooland-Spa-Cede—Residential Swimming Pools, spas and hot tubs reguiring a permil shall comply with

R326.2 through R326.4,

R326.2-Swimming pools shall be completely enclosed by a fence or barrler not less than 4 feet {1290
mm) In height or a screen enclosure, Qpenings In the fence gr barrier shail not permit the passage of a

4-Inch-dlameter {102 sphe
Exception:

1. Swimiming pools, spas and hot tubs on [ots In excess of 2 acres are exempt from the

requirements,

2. A swimming poo! with a power safely cover or a spa with a safety cover complying with ASTM F
1346 need not comply with this section. '

R326.3 Gates. Exterlor pedestrlan access doors or gates shali be self-closing and have a self-latching

device. Doors or gates other than pedestrian access doors or gates shall have a self-latching device,
Where the release mechanlsm of the self-latchlng device Is located less than 54 Inches {1372 mm)

from the bottom of the door or gate, the release mechanism shall be located op the pool side of the
door or gate 3 Inches {76 mm) or mere, below the top of the door or gate, and the door or gate and
barrler shall be without openings greater than 1[;Inch (12.7 mm) within 18 inches (457 mm) of the

release mechanism,
Exceptlon: Gates equipped with a tocking device,

326.4 trapment avoldanc

Suctlon outlets shall be deslaned and Installed in accordance with ANSI/APSP-7.




B-14

Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E.
Chairman

Oklahoma Uniform
Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE ADOPTION OF BUILDING/CONSTRUCTION CODES
PROPOSED CHANGE TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or fi lled out
completely, may not be considered. Each requested change must be on a scparate form.

[, Submitters Contact Information:

Name: OUBCC Technical Committee Date: Company:
Address:

City: State: Zip:

Phone: Ext: Fax:

Email;

2. Do you feel this proposed change will incrense {he cost of construction? [JYes X[ ]No

3. Which ave of the code needs revision?
Section:___R326 Table: ' Figure; Page No:

4. Please check the appropriate hox:
X Reviseas follows [] Delete as follows [ Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line ¢hy ough text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised),

See attached. Strike through portions are lo be placed in the appropriate appendices.
Additionally Appendix G from the 2009 IRC is to be added into the appendices.

Supporting information; State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change,

The Technical committee felt the International Swimuming Pool and Spa Code would require a
lot more deliberation before such a standard was suddenly imposed on the contractors and home
owners in the slate. In order to create a standard it was agreed the proposed requirements which
are largely consistent with the IBC would be a good minimum standard for pools,

5, Signature:

Send completed "Public Comment Form™ to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Cominission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157

Email to; Shawnta.Mitchell@oubce.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




SECTION R326 i
SWIMMING POOLS, SPAS AND HOT TUBS

R326.1 General. The-design-and-censtructio
Pooland-Spa-Code—Residential Swimming Pools, spas and hot tubs requiring a permit shall comply with

R326.2 through R326.4.

R326.2-Swimming pools shall be completely enclosed by a fence or bartler not less than 4 feet (1290
mm) In helght or a screen enclosure, Ope s In the fence arrier shall not permit the passage of a

4-Inch-diameter (102 mm) sphere.
Exception;

1. Swimming pools, spas and hot tubs on lots In excess of 2 acres are exempt from the

requlrements.
2. A swimming pool with a power safety cover or a spa with a safety cover complying with ASTM F

1346 need not comply with this section.

R326.3 Gates. Exterlor pedestrlan access doors or gates shall be self-closing and have a self-latching
device, Doors or gates other than pedestrlan access doors or gates shall have a seif-latching device.
Where the release mechanism of the self-latching device Is located less than 54 lnches (1372 mm)
from the bottom of the door or gate, the release mechanlsm shall be located on the pool side of the
door or gate 3 Inches (76 mm) or more the top of the door or gate, an door or qate and

barrier shall be without openlngs greater than llg_anh {(12.7 mm) within 18 Inches (457 mm) of the

reiease mechanlsm,
Exceptlon; Gates equipped a locking device.

R326.4 Entrapment avoldance.

Suction outlets shall be deslgned and Installed In accordance with ANSI/APSE-7.




By
Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E.
Chairman

Oklahoa niform
Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE ADOPTION OF BUILDING/CONSTRUCTION CODES
‘ PROPOSED CHANGE TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed, Any form not signed or filled out
completefy, may not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information;
Naine: QUBCC Date: 4/15/15

Company:
Address:
City: State; Zip:
Phone: Ext; Fax:
Email:

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ ] Yes No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:__ 402.2 Table: Figure: Page No:___ 80

4, Please check the appropriate hox:
[] Revise as follows  [] Delete as follows Add new text as follows [ | Delete with substitute

Show the propesed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative foxnat, (line through text to
be deleted and underjine text to be added or revised).

Add exception to Section 402.2 which states.

EXCEPTION: INTERIOR CONCRETE SLABS ON GRADE AND ENCLOSED GARAGE
SLABS ARE NOT REQUIRED TO BE AIR-ENTRAINED

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

In this climate zone there has been no historic problems with fieezing and thawing of garage
floors. Also hard steel trowe! finish of slabs generally removes the air entrainment,

5. Signature;

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157

Email to: Shawnta.Mitchell@oubee.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




Mary Fallin
Goveirnor

David Timberlake, P.E,
Chairman

OKklahoma Uniform
Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE ADOPTION OF BUILDING/CONSTRUCTION CODES
PROPOSED CHANGE TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or pristt clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out
completely, may not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: QUBCC Date: 4/15/15
Company:
Address:
City: State: Zip:
Phone: Ext: Fax:
Email:

2. Do you feel this proposed change will incrense the cost of construction? []Yes DJNo

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section; Table; Figure: R403.1{I) PageNo:__ 85

4. Please check the approprinte box:

[ ] Revise as follows  [] Delete as follows Add new text as follows [_] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised),

Add footnote g after “A, B and C” to Figure R403.1(1).

Footnote g to state “Add two #4 rcbar (o all footings. Additionally all cold joints between
footings and foundation walls (stem walls) shall be fied together by a #4 rebar at every corner
and not to exceed 6’ o,c. with embedment of 12” into each footing and wall,

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for (he change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

Currently the codes do not obligate reinforcement in footings in most soil conditions in
Oklahoma. Most cities have unique requirements for addressing this, With soils, seismic, and
wind concerns reinforcement is prudent.

5. Signature:

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157

Email to: Shawnta.Mitchell@oubcee.ok.gov or Fax (o: 405-521-6504




Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E.
Chairman

Okla llomniform
Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE ADOPTION OF BUILDING/CONSTRUCTION CODES
PROPOSED CHANGE TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly, Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out
completely, may not be considered, Each requested change must be on a separate form.

1. Submitters Contact Informaiion: _
Name: QUBCC Date: A/15/15

Company:
Address:
City: State: Zip:
Phone: Bxt: Fax:
Email:

2. Do you feel this proposed change will incrense the cost of construction? [ ] Yes No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:____403.1.6 Table: Figure: Page No: 89

4. Please check the appropriate box:
D4 Revise as follows [ Delete as follows [[] Add new toxt as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

After the words “plate section.” Revise the following text, “Interior bearing sole plates en
meonelithic-sleb-foundations that are not part of braced wall panels shall be positively anchored
with approved fasteners. Hand driven cut nails or concrete nails are not approved fasteners,

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change,

Hand diiven fasteners have a low probability of properly attaching a bearing sole plate to a
concrete floor.,

5. Signature:

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniforin Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklaloma City, OK 73157
Emait to: Shawnta.Mitchell@oubee.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




54"/
Mary Fallin
Goverpnor

David Timberlake, P.E.
Chairman

Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE ADOPTION OF BUILDING/CONSTRUCTION CODES
PROPOSED CHANGE TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly, Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out
completely, may not be considered, Each requested change must be on a separate form.

I. Submitters Contact Information:
Name: OUBCC _ Date: 4/15/15

Company:;
Address:
City: State: Zip:
Phone; Ext: Fax:
Email:

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [] Yes No

3. Which are of the code needs vevision?
Section:__ 403.1.7.3  Table: Figure: Page No: 90

4. Please check the appropriate box:
[] Revise as follows - Delete as follows  [] Add new text as follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

Delete the section of 403.1.7.3

Supporting information: State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support propased change.

This section is not always practical, and proper drainage can be achieved by a number of
methods depending on topography.,

5. Signature:

Send completed. "Public Comment Form" to;
Oklahoma Uniforin Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Shawnta.Mitchell@oubee.ok,gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E.
Chairman

Oklahoma Umfor ;o
Building Code Commlssmn !

1
\

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE MODIFICATION TO CODES\I‘OR THE ALTERNATIVE
FUEL FILLING STATIONS
PROPOSED CHANGE TO TIIE Ze / >’ LEc

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print ¢learly, Form must be signed. Any form not sngned or filled out completely, may
not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form,

. Submitters Contact Information:
Name; gm? Clart Date: /1571 S
Company: C.o. N
Address; 2215 Lind iy ue,g
City: Nertea State: O Iy Zip:_F3ey
Phone: Ext: Fax:
Email:___ &, cladt 76

2. Do yon feel this proposed change will inerease the cost of constraction? [ ] Yes @’(

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:_423.3.9.1 Table:__ . Figure: Page No:

4. Please¢/check the appropriaie box
evise as follows [ ] Defete as follows [ Add new textas follows [ ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line thl ough text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised),

_ SC’C Gf}'adu’

Supporifing inforination: State purpose aud reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

S. Sighature: é%/

Send completed "Public Cominent Form" to;
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Shawnta.Mitchell@oubee.ok.gov or Fax to; 405-521-6504




Add section P2604.4 to Chapter 4 create new section R403.1,9.1

R403.1.9.1 Protection of Footings. Trenching for work Including but not limited to plumbing,
electrical, storm shelters, and pools shall comply with this section, Trenching instatled parallef
to footings and walls shall not extend into the bearing plane of a footing or wall. The upper boundary

of the bearing plane is a line that extends downward, at an angle of 45 degrees from horizontal, from
the outside bottom edge of the footing or wall.

NN Y Y SN A DA
SIF NN L NI NN A
VAN 77ANN

— / ;l

( ) A 135
s
) J L/
i ( )<
N
7 TINSIALL PIPES
Y ABOVE THIS 1 INF




Receiveu 5-H

MAY 11 2015

Mary Fallin
[_ i |ng
C%Igeo oémﬁésmn

David Timbeslake, P.E,
Chairman

Oklahoma Uniform
Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE ADOPTION OF BUILDING/CONSTRUCTION CODES
PROPOSED CHANGE TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form ntust be signed, Any form not signed or filled out
cotpletely, may not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form,

. Submitters Contact Informatlon;
Name: Latry Cagle Date;_ 5-4-15
Company; Cagle Construction LLC

Address:____ 6701 E. Forest Ridpe Blvd.

City:__Broken Arrow State;__ OK Zip,___74014
Phone: 918-408-7484 Ext: Fax:__ 918-357-5305
Email; lcagle{@cox.net

2. Do you feel this proposed change whI Increase the cost of constraction? [] Yes No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Seclion:__R506,2,1 Table: Figure; Page No: 149

4. Please check the appropriate hox:
[XiRevise as follows [} Delete as follows 1 Add new text as follows ] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through (ext to
be deleted and underline text (o be added or revised), :

Fill material shall be free of vegetation and foreign material. The fill shall be compacted in 8 to [2"
lifts to ensure uniform support for slab and except where approved, the fill depths shall not exceed 48"
for clean sand or gravel and 8" for carth. Where fill deplhs exceed 48", the slab and stem wall system
shall be designed by accepled engineering practice/standards by a design professional,

Supporting informatiqn: State purpose and reason foy the change and provide subsiantiation to
support proposed change,

Many slabs localed in hilly terrain require fill depths exceeding 24" in height. As writlen, Seclion
R506.2.1 requires prior approval by the cade official or forces the bujlder to employ craw space
construction with associated venting problems, ete.  Since some jurisdictions do not perform pre-
construction plan veviews, the “where approved” provision does not always apply. Moreover, the cost of]
implementing craw space construction is, in inany cases, higher than slab constiuction with elevated fills.

ﬂé)ﬁ”‘#a’y‘%

Send completed "Public Comment Form" fo:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklatioma City, OK 73157
Email fo: Shawnta, Mitchell@oubee.ok.poy or Fax to: 405-521-6504

5. Signature:




Mary Fallin
Governor

David Timberlake, P.E,
Chairman

Oklahoa niform
Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE ADOPTION OF BUILDING/CONSTRUCTION CODES
PROPOSED CHANGE TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

INSTRUCTIONS: Please type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any form not signed or filled out
completely, may not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form,

. Submiiters Contact Informalion:
Name: OUBCC Date: 4/15/15
Company:
Address:
City: State; Zip:
Phone; Ext: Fax:
Email;

2. Do you feel this proposed ehange will increase the cost of construction? [ Yes No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?
Section:___ 506.2.3 Table: Figure: Page No: 149

4, Plense check the appropriafe box:

DX Revisc as follows  [] Delele as follows [] Add new text as follows [] Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised),

Revise 506.2.3 to say,

A 6 mil (0.006 inch; 152 micrometers) polyethylene sheeting, other industry accepted vapor
retarder products installed per manufacturer specifications or approved vapor retarder with joints

lapped not less than 6 inches (152 mm) shall be placed between the concrete floor slab and the
base course or the prepared subgrade where no base course exists.

Supporting information; State purpose and reason for the change and provide substantiation to
support proposed change.

The code limits vapor retarders to particular products while there are a number of options
available on the market,

5. Signature:

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to:
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157




David Timberlake, P,E,
Chairman

L4 L g

B-3(,
Mary Fallin
Governor

Oldahoa niform
Building Code Commission

PUBLIC COMMENT FORM FOR THE ADOPTION OF BUILDING/CONSTRUCTION CODES
PROPOSED CHANGE TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE®

INSTRUCTIONS: Piease type or print clearly. Form must be signed. Any forin not signed or filled out
completely, may not be considered. Each requested change must be on a separate form.

I. Submitters Contact Infovination:

Name: Chris Rainseyer Date:05/08/2015
Company: OUBCC

Address:__ 2401 Nw 23¢

City: OKC State: OK Zip: 73107
Phone: 405-521-650] Ext: Fax:

Email:

2. Do you feel this proposed change will increase the cost of construction? [ Yes No

3. Which are of the code needs revision?

Section; Table: R602.3(1) Page No:_|59

Figure:
4. Please check the appropriate box; |

[L] Revise as follows [JJ Delete as follows Add new text as follows [} Delete with substitute

Show the proposed NEW, REVISED, OR DELETED TEXT in legislative format, (line through text to
be deleted and underline text to be added or revised).

Add the following to Item 16:

Footnote: When 7/16” structural sheathing is used with a mini

mum nailing spacing of 6 inch on

the edge and 12" in the field, 2 -3”x 0.131”
top and bottom plate to stud connection.

nails are acceptable foe end nail conditions for the

Supporting information: State purpose and veason for the change and provide substantiation to

support proposed change,

This meets good engineering practices and

properly reflects the top and bottom plate to stud
connection typically used in Oklahoma home construction,

5. Signature;

Send completed "Public Comment Form" to: _
Oklahoma Uniform Building Code Commission, PO Box 12540, Oklahoma City, OK 73157
Email to: Shawnta.Mitchell@oubece.ok.gov or Fax to: 405-521-6504




