
Requisition #1310018554
Solicitation #1310004041
Closing Date6/20/2016
Buyer Bshubin- CPO

Line Item No. Description Quantity
Unit 
of 

Meas
Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension ype

1 vulcan VE-40 braising pan 1 ea alt. 11,728.30$ 11,728.30$    13,790.76$ 13,790.76$     15,022.96$  15,022.96$    15,435.32$    15,435.32$     
-$               -$                -$               -$               

2
bakery express DX-BMIH 
dough devider 1 ea no bid no bid  3,332.12$   3,332.12$       2,686.69$    2,686.69$      2,585.37$      2,585.37$       

-$               -$                -$               -$               
3 hobart 84186 food cutter 1 ea alt. 9,410.00$   9,410.00$      9,287.67$   9,287.67$       10,127.51$  10,127.51$    10,400.53$    10,400.53$     

-$               -$                -$               -$               

4
traulson G30010 reach in 
refrigerator 2 ea no bid no bid 4,409.15$   8,818.30$       4,517.96$    9,035.92$      alt. 4,063.68$      8,127.36$       

-$               -$                -$               -$               
Total Page 21,138.30$    35,228.85$     36,873.08$    36,548.58$    
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Pref
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Curtis Restaurant Supply of Tulsa OKDouglas Equipment of Bluefield WVCook's Direct of Warrenvillr IL

Vendor Name and AddressVendor Name and AddressVendor Name and Address

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Vendor Name and Address

Arctic Food Equipment of Springfield 
MO

Supplier Remarks: Supplier Remarks: Supplier Remarks:

vendor bid line 4 as Norlake NLR-
72-S

facility maintenance supervisor 
verified that alternate on line 4 
does meet specifications.

Buyer Tab NotesBuyer Tab Notes Buyer Tab Notes Buyer Tab Notes

facility maintenance supervisor 
verified that alternate on line 1 
does meet specifications.

 Line 1 is awarded to Cook's Direct of Warrenville IL. 
/    Lines 2 & 4 are awarded to Arctic Food 
Equipment of Springfirld MO.  /   Line 3 is awarded 
to Douglas Equipment of Bluefield WV. 

vendor bid line 1 as Groen BPP-
40E/ line 3 as Hobart 84186C-1  

Supplier Remarks:
Bid Awarded to

y y y y
 na na na na


