Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition # 1310018556 Vendor Name and Address Vendor Name and Address
Solicitation # 1310004039
Closing Date 7/21/2016 Club Tex, New York, NY Chem Tick Coated Fabrics, Hicksville, NY
Buyer Randy Pogue, CPO
Line Item No. Description Quantity Unit of Measure Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension
Mattress Protector, 39 1/2
1 inches wide, green. $ - $ -
1st year pricing 42200 yd $ 112 $  47,264.00 $ 121 $ 51,062.00
2nd year pricing 42200 yd $ 112 $  47,264.00 $ 124 $  52,328.00
3rd year pricing 42200 yd $ 112 $  47,264.00 $ 127 $  53,594.00
Mattress Protector, 54
2 inches wide, green. $ - $ -
1st year pricing 2200 yd $ 170 $ 3,740.00 $ 170 $ 3,740.00
2nd year pricing 2200 yd $ 170 $ 3,740.00 $ 175 $ 3,850.00
3rd year pricing 2200 yd $ 170 $ 3,740.00 $ 180 $ 3,960.00
3 Ticking $ - $ -
1st year pricing 5100 yd No Bid No Bid $ 415 $  21,165.00
2nd year pricing 5100 yd No Bid No Bid $ 423 $  21573.00
3rd year pricing 5100 yd No Bid No Bid $ 432 $  22,032.00
Total Page $ 153,012.00 $ 233,304.00
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference) NY / Tied Bids NY / Tied Bids

VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)

Bid Awarded to

Supplier Remarks:

Supplier Remarks:

Split award. Lines 1 and 2 awarded to Club Tex of New York, NY
and Line 3 awarded to Chem Tick of Hicksville, NY.

Lead time: 60-90 days

Lead time: 30-45 days

Buyer Tab Notes

Buyer Tab Notes




