Oklahoma Department of Corrections
Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition # 1310017824 Vendor Name and Address Vendor Name and Address
Solicitation # 1310003926
Closing Date 5/28/2015 | Brenntag Southwest, Sand Springs, OK J Tech Sales LLC, Boca Raton, FL.
Buyer Randy Pogue, CPO
Line ltem No. Description Quantity  Unitof Measure | Type  Unit Cost Extension Type  UnitCost Extension
CHEMICALS:Sodium
Chloride, Evaporated Salt
1 Food Grade $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 450 LB $ 018 $ 81.00 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 450 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 450 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
CHEMICALS:Sodium
Metasilicate
2 Pentaryhydrate $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 650 LB $ 044 $ 286.00 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 650 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 650 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
CHEMICALS:Sodium
3 Triplyphosphate $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 1500 LB $ 088 $ 1,320.00 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 1500 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 1500 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
CHEMICALS:Witconate
4 1260 $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 10400 LB $ 142 $  14,768.00 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 10400 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 10400 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
WITCONATE AOS,
ALPHA-OLEFIN-
SULFANATE BY
PILOT OR AN
5 APPROVED EQUAL $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 5125 LB $ 085 $ 4,356.25 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 5125 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 5125 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
6 GLYCOL ETHER $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 820 LB $ 088 $ 721.60 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 820 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 820 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
ALCOHOL
7 ETHOXYLATE $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 15575 LB $ 207 $  32,240.25 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 15575 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 15575 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
ALCOHOL:
8 ISOPROPYL ALCOHOL $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 362 LB $ 088 $ 318.56 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 362 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 362 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
SODIUM:50lb,
9 Bicarbonate $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 750 LB $ 028 $ 210.00 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 750 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 750 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
CHEMICALS:Sodium
10 Carbonate $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 500 LB $ 027 $ 135.00 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 500 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 500 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
CHEMICALS:Witconate
1 68KN $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 1920 LB $ 182 $ 3,494.40 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 1920 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 1920 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
TETRASODIUM EDTA
12 CIBAGEIGY CIBA $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 2400 LB $ 064 $ 1,536.00 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 2400 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 2400 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
13 CALSOFT F- 90 $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 400 LB $ 286 $ 1,144.00 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 400 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 400 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
LIPOLASE 100L, TYPE
14 EX $ - -
1ST YEAR PRICING 1321 LB $ 1625 $  21466.25 $ 9.94 13,130.74
2ND YEAR PRICING 1321 LB No bid No bid $ 9.94 13,130.74
3RD YEAR PRICING 1321 LB No bid No bid 9.965 13,163.77
SODIUM:55ga,
15 Hypochlorite $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 5060 LB $ 011 $ 556.60 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 5060 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 5060 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
CHEMICALS:Sodium
16 Hydroxide $ - $ -
1ST YEAR PRICING 2100 LB $ 028 $ 588.00 No bid No bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 2100 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
3RD YEAR PRICING 2100 LB No bid No bid No bid No bid
17 CHEMICAL: Savinase $ - -
1ST YEAR PRICING 1763 LB $ 1225 $ 21596.75 $ 6.65 11,723.95
2ND YEAR PRICING 1763 LB No bid No bid $ 6.65 11,723.95
3RD YEAR PRICING 1763 LB No bid No bid 6.675 11,768.03
Total Page $ 104,818.66 74,641.17
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference) OK /N/A FL / Tied Bids

VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y /N)

Bid Awarded to

Supplier Remarks:

Supplier Remarks:

Split award. Lines 1-12 and 14-16 awarded to Brenntag Southwest|
of Sand Springs, OK. Lines 13 and 17 awarded to J Tech Sales
LLC of Boca Raton, FL. Splitting award results in a savings of
$18,208.31.

Lead Time: 3-14 Days

Lead Time: 3-7 Working Days

Buyer Tab Notes

Buyer Tab Notes




