
Requisition #
Solicitation #
Closing Date
Buyer

Line Item No. Description Quantity Unit of Measure Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension

1

FRANK CASING.  WEINIE PACK, 27 MM X 
70 FT. CLOSED END. 300 STRANDS PER 
CASE.  -$                   -$                   
1ST PERIOD PRICING 70 CA 401.00$     28,070.00$        586.49$     41,054.30$        
2ND YEAR PRICING 70 CA 421.00$     29,470.00$        596.85$     41,779.50$        

2

ITALIAN CASING, EDIBLE COLLAGEN 
CASING, 30 MM X 70 FT STRANDS.   108 
STRANDS PER CASE. -$                   -$                   
1ST PERIOD PRICING 30 CA No Bid No Bid 487.62$     14,628.60$        
2ND YEAR PRICING 30 CA No Bid No Bid 501.35$     15,040.50$        

3

HOT LINK CASING, 31 MM X 84 FT, RED 
TRANSFERABLE CELLULOSE CASING, 200 
STRANDS PER CASE. -$                   -$                   
1ST PERIOD PRICING 20 CA 495.00$     9,900.00$          659.81$     13,196.20$        
2ND YEAR PRICING 20 CA 515.00$     10,300.00$        669.95$     13,399.00$        

Total Page 77,740.00$       139,098.10$     
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference)
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)

OH / N/A NJ / Tied Bids

Split award.  Lines 1 and 3 awarded to Sky Resources LLC of Columbus, OH and Line 2 
awarded to Globe Packaging Co of Carlstatdt, NJ.

Lead Time:  12 Weeks Lead Time:  13 Weeks
Bid Awarded to

Buyer Tab NotesBuyer Tab Notes

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Supplier Remarks: Supplier Remarks:

Randy Pogue, CPO

1310017737
1310003918

4/30/2015

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Globe Packaging Co, Carlstadt, NJSky Resources LLC, Columbus, OH

Vendor Name and AddressVendor Name and Address


