
Requisition #
Solicitation #
Closing Date
Buyer

Line Item No. Description Quantity Unit of Measure Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension

1

CLOTH:  Bleached White 
Sheeting 50% 
Polyester/50% Cotton 40000 yd 1.02$         40,800.00$        No Bid No Bid 1.06$         42,400.00$        

2

CLOTH:Orange Twill, 
35% Cotton, 65% 
Polyester 20000 yd 2.03$         40,600.00$        1.83$         36,600.00$        1.90$         38,000.00$        

3 CLOTH:  Terry, White 30000 yd 2.18$         65,400.00$        No Bid No Bid 1.93$         57,900.00$        
Total Page 146,800.00$     36,600.00$       138,300.00$     
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference)
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)

FL / Tied Bids CA / Tied Bids FL / Tied Bids

Split award.  Line 1 awarded to T Roberts Fabric of Ft Lauderdale, 
FL, line 2 awarding to Palma Trading LLC of Newport Coast, CA 
and Line 3 awarded to Jag Textile Company, Ft Lauderdale, FL.  
Total cost is $135,300.00 resulting in a cost savings of $3,000.00 for 
the State.

Supplier Remarks:
Bid Awarded to

Buyer Tab NotesBuyer Tab Notes Buyer Tab Notes

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Supplier Remarks: Supplier Remarks:

Randy Pogue, CPO

1310016961
1310003869

7/23/2014

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Jag Textile Company, Ft Lauderdale, FLPalma Trading LLC, Newport Coast, CAT Roberts Fabrics, Ft Lauderdale, FL

Vendor Name and AddressVendor Name and AddressVendor Name and Address


