
Requisition #
Solicitation #
Closing Date
Buyer

Line Item No. Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension

1
HEAVY DUTY MATTRESS 
PROTECTOR SYNTHETIC -$                  -$                  -$                  
1ST YEAR PRICING 22000 YD 1.22$         26,840.00$        1.27$         27,940.00$        1.20$         26,400.00$        
2ND YEAR PRICING 22000 YD 1.25$         27,500.00$        1.29$         28,380.00$        1.20$         26,400.00$        

2
HEAVY DUTY MATTRESS 
PROTECTOR SYNTHETIC -$                  -$                  -$                  
1ST YEAR PRICING 4500 YD 1.80$         8,100.00$          1.75$         7,875.00$          2.20$         9,900.00$          
2ND YEAR PRICING 4500 YD 1.84$         8,280.00$          1.79$         8,055.00$          2.20$         9,900.00$          

3 ACA STANDARD TICKING -$                  -$                  -$                  
1ST YEAR PRICING 5400 YD 4.15$         22,410.00$        4.46$         24,084.00$        No Bid No Bid
2ND YEAR PRICING 5400 YD 4.23$         22,842.00$        4.48$         24,192.00$        No Bid No Bid

Total Page 115,972.00$     120,526.00$     72,600.00$       
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference)
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)

NY / Tied Bids FL / Tied Bids PA / Tied Bids

Overall low bid awarded to ChemTick Coated Fabrics of 
Hicksville, NY.

Brand bid:  ChemSafe.  Lead Time: 
Line 1- 14-21 Days, Line 2- 21-28 
Days, Line 3- 30-45 Days

Brands bid: Lines 1-2- Correct Tick, 
Line 3- Spec Tex.  Lead Time:  7-14 
Days.

Lead Time:  10 Days ARO

Supplier Remarks:
Bid Awarded to

Minimum order quantities: Line 1- 
10,000 yards, Line 2- 3,000 yards, 
Line 3- 900 yards

Buyer Tab NotesBuyer Tab Notes Buyer Tab Notes

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Supplier Remarks: Supplier Remarks:

Randy Pogue, CPO

1310016568
1310003848

5/21/2014

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Herculite Products, Emigsville, PASpec-Tex Inc, Coral Springs, FLChemTick Coated Fabrics, Hicksville, NY

Vendor Name and AddressVendor Name and AddressVendor Name and Address


