Oklahoma Department of Corrections
Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition # 1310016566 Vendor Name and Address Vendor Name and Address
Solicitation # 1310003847
Closing Date 5/21/2014 Comade Inc, Santa Ana, CA
Buyer Randy Pogue, CPO
Line Item No. Description Quantity Unit of Measure Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension
INNERSPRINGS UNIT-STANDARD
INSTITUTIONAL TWIN TYPE 312;

1 DIMENSIONS: 34" X 73" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 750 EA $ 3600 $ 27,000.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 750 EA $ 3700 $ 27,750.00 $
INNERSPRINGS UNIT - STANDARD
INSTITUTIONAL XL TWIN TYPE

2 312-BR6; DIMENSIONS: 34" X 79" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 10 EA $ 4500 $ 450.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 10 EA $ 4500 $ 450.00 $
INNERSPRINGS UNIT - TWIN.

TYPE 312-BR6. DIMENSIONS: 36

3 172" X 73", $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 300 EA $ 36.00 $ 10,800.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 300 EA $ 3700 $ 11,100.00 $
INNERSPRINGS UNIT - TWIN XL.

TYPE 312-BR6; DIMENSIONS: 36

4 1/2" X 78". $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 30 EA $ 4050 $ 1,215.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 30 EA $ 4050 $ 1,215.00 $
INNERSPRINGS UNIT - FULL.

TYPE 312- BR-6; DIMENSIONS:

5 51.5" X 73". $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 100 EA $ 4500 $ 4,500.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 100 EA $ 4500 $ 4,500.00 $
INNERSPRINGS UNIT - FULL XL.

TYPE 312 BR6; DIMENSIONS: 51.5"

6 X 78" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 5 EA $ 5040 $ 252.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 5 EA $ 5040 $ 252.00 $
INNERSPRINGS PREBUILT
HOSPITAL UNIT. STANDARD
INSTITUTIONAL TWIN. TYPE312-

7 BC9; SIZE: 34" X 74", $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 290 EA $ 3375 $ 9,787.50 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 290 EA $ 3500 $ 10,150.00 $
INNERSPRINGS PREBUILT
HOSPITAL UNIT. STD. INST.TWIN -

8 XL. TYPE 312-BC9; SIZE: 34" X 79" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 80 EA $ 3940 $ 3,152.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 80 EA $ 3940 $ 3,152.00 $
INNERSPRINGS UNIT (LURAFLEX) -

TWIN. TYPE 660-BR6;

9 DIMENSIONS 36 1/2" X 73" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 150 EA $ 53.00 $ 7,950.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 150 EA $ 5300 $ 7,950.00 $
INNERSPRINGS UNIT (LURAFLEX) -

TWIN XL TYPE 660-BR6;

10 DIMENSIONS 36 1/2" X 78" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 30 EA $ 5500 $ 1,650.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 30 EA $ 5500 $ 1,650.00 $
INNERSPRINGS UNIT - FULL, TYPE

11 660-BR6; DIMENSIONS: 51.5" X 73" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 2 EA $ 7000 $ 140.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 2 EA $ 7000 $ 140.00 $
INNERSPRINGS UNIT - FULL XL.

TYPE 660-BR6; DIMENSIONS: 51.5"

12 X 78" $ - $

1ST YEAR PRICING 1 EA $ 7500 $ 75.00 $




2ND YEAR PRICING 1EA $ 7500 $ 75.00 $
INNERSPRINGS UNIT (LURAFLEX)
- QUEEN. TYPE 660-BR6;

13 DIMENSIONS: 55.5" X 77.5" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 1EA $ 8500 $ 85.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 1 EA $ 8500 $ 85.00 $
MOUNTED BOX SPRING UNIT -

TWIN. TYPE 81 07SAW C1XBCC.

14 FRAME: 37" X 73.5" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 35 EA No Bid No Bid $
2ND YEAR PRICING 35 EA No Bid No Bid $
MOUNTED BOX SPRING UNIT -

TWIN XL. TYPE 81 07SAW

15 C1XBCC; FRAME: 37" X 78.5" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 2 EA No Bid No Bid $
2ND YEAR PRICING 2 EA No Bid No Bid $
MOUNTED BOX SPRING UNIT -

FULL. TYPE 81 07SAW C1XBCC.

16 FRAME: 52" X 73 1/2" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 2 EA No Bid No Bid $
2ND YEAR PRICING 2 EA No Bid No Bid $
MOUNTED BOX SPRING UNIT -

QUEEN. TYPE 81 07SAW C1XBCC;

17 FRAME: 59" X 78 1/2" $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 2 EA No Bid No Bid $
2ND YEAR PRICING 2 EA No Bid No Bid $
EDGE GUARD SPRING CLIP

18 SIZE: 5-3/4:, 11GA $ - $
1ST YEAR PRICING 2400 EA $ 050 $ 1,200.00 $
2ND YEAR PRICING 2400 EA $ 052 $ 1,248.00 $

Total Page $  99,271.50 $
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference) CA/ Tied Bids

VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)

Bid Awarded to

Supplier Remarks:

Supplier Remarks:

Single bid awarded to Comade Inc of Santa Ana, CA at Fair Market Price.

Lead Time: 21 Days ARO. Brand
Bid: Spiller.

Buyer Tab Notes

Buyer Tab Notes






