
Requisition #
Solicitation #
Closing Date
Buyer

Line Item No. Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Extension Unit Cost Extension Unit Cost Extension Unit Cost Extension

1
WASHING MACHINE: 
Clothes, commercial 2 EA 10,500.00$ 21,000.00$    No Bid No Bid 11,570.00$ 23,140.00$    14,500.00$ 29,000.00$    

2
WASHING MACHINE: 
Clothes, commercial 1 EA 7,600.00$   7,600.00$      No Bid No Bid 8,078.00$   8,078.00$      10,000.00$ 10,000.00$    

3
WASHING MACHINE: 
Clothes, commercial 8 EA 831.00$      6,648.00$      -$            -$              -$              

4
DRYER: Clothes, 
commercial 7 EA 757.00$      5,299.00$      564.00$      3,948.00$   540.00$      3,780.00$      600.00$      4,200.00$      

Total Page 40,547.00$   3,948.00$   34,998.00$   43,200.00$   
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference)
VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y / N)

Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Aadvantage Laundry Systems, 
Tulsa, OK

ALS Commercial Equipment, 
Jacksonville, FL

Elite Equipment Co, Oklahoma 
City, OK

Vendor Name and AddressVendor Name and AddressVendor Name and Address

Oklahoma Department of Corrections

Vendor Name and Address

Arrow Machinery Co, Oklahoma 
City, OK

Supplier Remarks: Supplier Remarks:

Randy Pogue, CPO

1310015221
1310003698

5/2/2013

Supplier Remarks:

Lead Time:  12 weeks on 
lines 1-2, 4 weeks on lines 3-
4.  Brand bid: Milnor on lines 
1-2, Whirlpool on line 4.

Line 3 specifications stated 
minimum 3.2 cu ft.  Brand 
bid was 2.9 cu ft.  Non-
responsive bid on line 3.

Buyer Tab NotesBuyer Tab Notes Buyer Tab Notes Buyer Tab NotesOverall low responsive bid awarded to Elite Equipment of Oklahoma City, OK.

Lead Time:  2-3 weeks on 
lines 1-2, 2 weeks on lines 3-
4.  Brand bid:  Maytag.

Lead Time:  14 days.  
Brand bid:  Whirlpool.

Lead Time:  20 Days/4 
Weeks.  Brand bid:  Unimac.

Supplier Remarks:
Bid Awarded to

Line 3 specifications 
stated minimum 3.2 cu ft.  
Brand bid was 2.9 cu ft.  
Non-responsive bid on 
line 3.

Line 3 specifications stated 
minimum 3.2 cu ft.  Brand 
bid was 2.8 cu ft.  Non-
responsive bid on line 3.

Y Y Y Y
OK / None FL / Tied Bids OK / None OK / None


