Oklahoma Department of Corrections
Contracts & Acquisitions Unit
Bid Tabulation Sheet

Requisition # 1310014917 Vendor Name and Address Vendor Name and Address Vendor Name and Address Vendor Name and Address
Solicitation # 1310003634
Closing Date 1/30/2013 Sam Tell and Son, Farmingdale, NY Federal Supply USA, Waukegan, IL Cook's Direct, Warrensville, 1L Culinary Depot, Monsey, NY
Buyer Randy Pogue, CPO
Line Item No. Description Quantity '\;J:;;?:e Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension Type Unit Cost Extension
1 Ice Maker with Ice Bin 1EA $3,083.97 $ 3,083.97 $3,060.00 $ 3,060.00 $2,689.00 $ 2,689.00 $ -
Proofer Holding Cabinet,
2 Moble 1EA $1,743.77 3 1,743.77 $1,290.00 $ 1,290.00 $1,933.00 $ 1,933.00 $ -
3 Ice Maker with Ice Bin 1EA $3,103.09 $ 3,103.09 $ - $3,239.00 $ 3,239.00 $ -
4 Manual Meat Slicer 1EA $6,453.47 $ 6,453.47 $3,065.00 $ 3,065.00 $2,998.00 $ 2,998.00 $ -
Folding Roll-A-Way Table
5 with Benches 5EA $1,40401 $ 7,020.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ -
Total Page $ 21,404.35 $ 7,415.00 $ 10,859.00 $ -
RECIPROCITY 74 O.S. 4.85.17A (State / Preference) NY / Tied Bids IL / Tied Bids IL / Tied Bids

[VENDOR REGISTERED? (Y I N)

Supplier Remarks:

Supplier Remarks:

Supplier Remarks:

Supplier Remarks:

Bid Awarded to

Split Award. Lines 3 and 5 awarded to Sam Tell and Son. Line

Line 1: Bid Scotsman. Line 2: Bid
\Win-Holt. Line 3: Manitowoc. Line
4: Bid Hobart 2712C. Line 5: Bid
Sico.

Line 1: Bid Scotsman. Line 2: Bid
Win-Holt. Line 4: Bid Univex-100M.

Line 1: Bid Ice-O-Matic. Line 2: Bid
\Win-Holt. Line 3: Bid Manitowoc .
Line 4: Bid Globe #3600-N w/ Prison
Ipackage.

2 awarded to Federal Supply USA. Line 1 awarded to Cook's

Buyer Tab Notes

Buyer Tab Notes

Buyer Tab Notes

Buyer Tab Notes

Direct. Line 4 not awarded because of incomplete
specifications in bid. Line 4 will be re-bid.

Whited on price on line 3, wrote new
price and didn't initial. Non-
responsive for line 3.

Vendor did not send in "Solicitation
Request" pages filled out, only sent in
a quote on vendor letterhead. NON-
RESPONSIVE BID.




