
Instructions - For each category price the job titles you support within each category, provide hourly not-to-exceed rates for each level and technology type as applicable.
Refer to the Staffing Categories in Attachment A for guidance on responsibilities/titles within each category. 
Pricing must include travel costs

Definitions:
Level 1 - Has basic knowledge or limited experience.
Level II - Has intermediate practical application skills. 
Level III - Has advanced to expert skills in application and recognition of solutions.

Category Title Level I, II & III

NTE Hourly 
Pricing Non 
Technology Legacy Core Emerging

 Administrative Services
Administrative Services Level I $65.00 $66.00 $70.00 $76.00
Administrative Services Level II $74.00 $78.00 $82.00 $87.00
Administrative Services Level III $82.00 $94.00 $98.00 $104.00

Project Management
Project Manager Level I $72.00 $76.00 $82.00
Project Manager Level II $100.00 $104.00 $110.00
Project Manager Level III $128.00 $132.00 $155.00

Application Development and Support
Application Developer/Programmer Level I $66.00 $70.00 $82.00
Application Developer/Programmer Level II $89.00 $93.00 $104.00
Application Developer/Programmer Level III $117.00 $121.00 $155.00
Application Support Level I $66.00 $70.00 $76.00
Application Support Level II $89.00 $93.00 $98.00
Application Support Level III $106.00 $110.00 $115.00
Application Analyst Level I $66.00 $70.00 $76.00
Application Analyst Level II $89.00 $93.00 $98.00
Application Analyst Level III $106.00 $110.00 $115.00
System Analyst Level I $66.00 $70.00 $76.00
System Analyst Level II $83.00 $87.00 $93.00
System Analyst Level III $94.00 $98.00 $104.00
Software Test Analyst Level I $66.00 $70.00 $76.00
Software Test Analyst Level II $72.00 $76.00 $82.00
Software Test Analyst Level III $83.00 $87.00 $93.00

Enterprise Application Environment
Application Administrator Level I $72.00 $76.00 $82.00
Application Administrator Level II $94.00 $98.00 $105.00

Pricing Template - Attachment C Technology Type - NTE Hourly Pricing



Graphic Designer Level I $50.00 $54.00 $63.00
Graphic Designer Level II $61.00 $65.00 $71.00
Graphic Designer Level III $67.00 $71.00 $82.00
Web Developer Level I $61.00 $65.00 $76.00
Web Developer Level II $72.00 $76.00 $87.00
Web Developer Level III $83.00 $87.00 $99.00
API/Web Services Developer Level I $61.00 $65.00 $76.00
API/Web Services Developer Level II $72.00 $76.00 $87.00
API/Web Services Developer Level III $83.00 $87.00 $99.00

Computer Break/Fix Services
Computing Device Support Level I No Bid
Computing Device Support Level II No Bid
Computing Device Support Level III No Bid

Technical Grant Proposal Services
Technical Grant Writer Level I $50.00 $54.00 $60.00
Technical Grant Writer Level II $61.00 $65.00 $71.00
Technical Grant Writer Level III $72.00 $76.00 $87.00

Quality Management Coordinator/Lead $72.00 $76.00 $82.00
Software Tester $72.00 $76.00 $82.00
Accessibility Compliance Tester $72.00 $76.00 $82.00
Information Systems Performance 
Management Specialist $83.00 $87.00 $93.00

Cloud Solutions Architect/Engineer Level I $100.00 $104.00 $115.00
Level II $117.00 $121.00 $126.00
Level III $128.00 $132.00 $155.00

Engineer Level I $78.00 $82.00 $93.00
Level II $95.00 $99.00 $110.00
Level III $111.00 $115.00 $127.00

Accessibility Quality Assurance

Cloud Solutions

Artificial Intelligence/Machine Learning



Application Administrator Level III $111.00 $115.00 $121.00
Enterprise Architecture

Technical Architect Level I $83.00 $87.00 $98.00
Technical Architect Level II $94.00 $98.00 $110.00
Technical Architect Level III $106.00 $110.00 $121.00
Business Architect Level I  $66.00 $70.00 $78.00
Business Architect Level III $83.00 $87.00 $95.00
Business Architect Level III $94.00 $98.00 $107.00

Customer Service/Helpdesk
Help Desk Support Level I No Bid
Help Desk Support Level II No Bid
Help Desk Support Level III No Bid
Technical Support Level I No Bid
Technical Support Level II No Bid
Technical Support Level III No Bid

Data Services
Database/Warehouse  Architect Level I $78.00 $82.00 $93.00
Database/Warehouse  Architect Level II $89.00 $93.00 $105.00
Database/Warehouse  Architect Level III $111.00 $115.00 $132.00
Database Administrator Level I $75.00 $76.00 $87.00
Database Administrator Level II $86.00 $90.00 $99.00
Database Administrator Level III $108.00 $112.00 $121.00

Information Technology Security
Security Analyst Level I $61.00 $65.00 $76.00
Security Analyst Level II $83.00 $87.00 $93.00
Security Analyst Level III $95.00 $99.00 $110.00
Security Engineer $100.00 $104.00 $127.00
Security Architect $117.00 $121.00 $160.00

Systems and Component - Administration/Design/Support
Network Engineer Level I $72.00 $76.00 $87.00
Network Engineer Level II $78.00 $82.00 $93.00
Network Engineer Level III $89.00 $93.00 $104.00
Network Administrator Level I $61.00 $65.00 $76.00
Network Administrator Level II $67.00 $71.00 $82.00
Network Administrator Level III $78.00 $82.00 $93.00

Training and Communications
Communications Coordinator Level I No Bid
Communications Coordinator Level II No Bid
Communications Coordinator Level III No Bid

Digital Design and Development
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