Product Description

Manufacturer Item # . Product Categor
uiactu (Required) " gory
Example Only Below - All Yellow Boxes REQUIRED:
MSF8308GR 72" Refrigerated Prep Table 24131503

Complete all items below. If Supplier does not offer exact item as listed, Supplier may offer a comparable

CNF-0201A Ice Maker & Water Dispenser Manitowoc
EV93 Water filter Insurice 2000 EVERPURE
630-PW120 Heater proofer cabinet ADMIRAL CRAFT
ER-EMGR33 Reach-In Glass Door EVEREST
R-21LCFS Microwave Oven, 1000 watts, ACP
NM-6800 Conveyor Toaster, electric, NEMCO

4543-D2-120V
UBS1000 BEIG

eco coffee brewer, decanter style, BLOOMFIELD
Ultra Camtainer 10.5 gallon CAMBRO

1304-00999 SPEC SERIES® Heated Cabinet TRUE
25038A9 Water Boiler electric 100 NO BID
VC55GD Convection Oven VULCAN
C-54-208-3-QS Booster Heater HATCO
MSF8308GR 72" Refrigerated Prep Table ATOSA
F-801MAIJ-C Ice Maker HOSHIZAKI
E-6-CBPG Steam Table NO BID
1826DTC131 Tray Cart CAMBRO
WRFS555SDFZ Refrigerator / Freezer NO BID
VC5GD Convection Oven VULCAN
1675KIT48 Gas Connector DORMONT
LVRCS8S Drinking Fountain NO BID
Supplier Acknowledgement -
Supplier submits catalog or price
sheet of all products supporting
the scope of this solicitation YES NO YES

Note: The intention of this effort is to not overly burden Supplier and allow the submission of existing cat
Supplier must clearly indicate discount percentage as blanket for entire catalog, individually discounted b



Unit
Supplier Item # UNSPSC MSRP (Required) of Measure
Code .
(Required)
1234567 31201509 $4,000.00 EACH/SET/Etc.

make/model within its offering which is as nearly identical as possible. If Supplier does not offer exa:

CNF0201A 11675 EACH
EV932421 854 EACH
PW-120 $3,212.66 EACH
EMGR33 $7,818.57 EACH
RCS10DSE $1,285.00 EACH
6800 $1,547.00 EACH
4543-D2-120V $586.00 EACH
UC1000157 $590.00 EACH
TH-23 16703.00 EACH
NO BID
VG55GD 46770.54 EACH
C-54-208-3-QS 8016.00 EACH
MSF8308GR 4696 EACH
F-801MAJ-C $13,240.00 EACH
1826DTC131 $3,240.00 EACH
VC5GD $22,973.00 EACH
1675KIT48 $505.54 EACH

As of right now we are
submitting this without
installation. If | do receive an
install quote | will get it over as
soon as possible

alogs or price sheets of items which support the scope of this solicitation.
y manufaturerer/quantity/or other critera as determined by Supplier. Supplier maintains responsibili



Quantity Discount to MSRP Discounted Price (MSRP minus
(Required) (Required) Discount to MSRP) (Required)
1.00 50.00% $2,000.00
ct or comparable item, then Supplier will so indicate.

1 60.28 4637.51

1 56.44 371.98

1 47.75 1678.62

1 64.33 2788.6

1 65.75 440.08

1 52.11 740.94

1 53.65 271.61

1 53.65 273.47

$1.00 68.36 5285.1

$1.00 75.41 11498.96

$1.00 45 4408.8

1.00% $32.00 3193.28

1.00 52.98% $6,226.11

1.00 55.00% $1,458.00

1.00 62.14% $8,696.94

1.00 59.91% $202.70

ity for ensuring all pricing/discount inforation is presented as clearly as possible.




	1. Market Basket of Goods

