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This addendum is added to and is to be considered part of the subject contract. 

 

 

 The contract has been extended for ninety (90) days.  
 
Contract Period:  12/05/2021 through 03/04/2022 
    
The following vendors are in good standing and have elected to extend their contracts:  
 
0000072723 Contract ID# 6343 
Ross Transportation, Inc 
Oklahoma City, OK  
 
00004501011Contract ID#6344 
Summit Truck Center 
Dallas, TX 
 
Ross Transportation had an approved price adjustment per the terms of the contract, and their updated 
pricing is enclosed. 
 

 

 

 Statewide Contract  
Addendum 

Statewide Contract #:    SW0110 

PeopleSoft Contract ID:    See Below 

Contract Title:    School Buses 

Contract Issuance Date:    01/16/2019 

Contract Supplier:     See Below 

                  Addendum #    8 

 

             Addendum Date:    11/23/2021 

  

OMES Point of Contact: 
 

        Contracting Officer:  Joseph Farani 

Phone Number:   405-521-6668 

E-mail address:   joseph.farani@omes.ok.gov 

  

Addendum Information: Contract extension 
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H. PRICE AND COST

H.1. Pricing for Regular Route Buses (Yellow)

H.1.1. Type C, Up to 39 Passengers $ 

H.1.2. Type C, 40 to 42 Passengers $ 

H.1.3. Type C, 43 to 48 Passengers $ 

H.1.4. Type C, 49 to 54 Passengers $ 

H.1.5. Type C, 55 to 59 Passengers $ 

H.1.6. Type C, 60 to 65 Passengers $ 

H.1.7. Type C, 66 to 71 Passengers $ 

H.1.8. Type C, 72 to 77 Passengers $ 

H.2. Pricing for MFSAB Buses

H.2.1.  Type C, 55 to 59 Passengers $ 

H.2.2. Type C, 60 to 65 Passengers $ 

H.2.3. Type C, 66 to 71 Passengers $ 

H.2.4. Type C, 72 to 77 Passengers $ 

H.3. Pricing for Specially Equipped Buses

H.3.1. Type A, Up to 20 Passenger $ 

H.3.2. Type A, 21 to 28 Passenger $ 

H.3.3. Type A, 29 to 36 Passenger $ 

H.3.4. Type B, Up to 30 Passenger $ 

H.3.5. Type B, 31 to 36 Passenger $ 

H.3.6. Type C, Up to 39 Passengers $ 

H.3.7. Type C, 40 to 42 Passengers $ 

H.3.8. Type C, 43 to 48 Passengers $ 

H.3.9. Type C, 49 to 54 Passengers $ 

H.3.10. Type C, 55 to 59 Passengers $ 

H.3.11. Type C, 60 to 65 Passengers $ 

H.3.12. Type C, 66 to 71 Passengers $ 

H.3.13. Type C, 72 to 77 Passengers $ 

H.4. Pricing for Transit Buses

H.4.1. Type D Route, 70-90 Passenger $

H.4.2. Type D. MFSAB, 70-90 Passenger $

H.5. Pricing for Type “A” Passenger Buses

H.5.1. Type A, Up to 20 Passenger $ 

H.5.2. Type A, 21 to 28 Passenger $ 

H.5.3. Type A, 29 to 36 Passenger $ 

$83,248.00 

NO BID

$86,720.00

$87,819.00

$88,093.00

$89,401.00

$90,168.00
90,751.00

$88,555.00

NO BID

NO BID

$88,735.00

$89,512.00

$90,095.00

$59,588.00 

$66,468.00

$66,911.00

NO BID

$105,842.00

$107,289.00

 $109,242.00

$108,189.00

$109,501.00

$111,523.00

$109,732.00

$111,067.00

$102,286.00 (77 Passenger, Front Engine / Route)  /  $103,849.00 (83 Passenger, Front Engine / Route)  

$ 1113,342.00 (78 Passenger, Rear Engine / Route)   / $113,677.00 (84 Passenger, Rear Engine / Route)

$116,717.00 (78 Passenger, Rear Engine / MFSAB)  /   $117,053.00 (84 Passenger, Rear Engine / MFSAB)

$57,565.00 (14 Passenger, Route )         /      $57,845.00 (14 Passenger, MFSAB)

$57,764.00 (23 Passenger, Route )
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H.6. Pricing for Type “B” Passenger Buses

H.6.1. Type B, Up to 30 Passenger $ 

H.6.2. Type B, 31 to 36 Passenger $ 

H.7. Pricing for Optional Specified Items

H.7.1. Fire Suppression Systems (Section C.70) $ 

H.7.2. Passenger Compartment Air Conditioning (Section C.71) $ 

H.7.3. Insulation (Section C.72) $ 

H.7.4. Retarder System (Section C.73) $ 

H.7.5. Storage Compartment (Section C.74) $ 

H.7.6. Traction Assisting Devices (Section C.75) $ 

H.7.7. Trash Container and Holding Device (Section C.76) $ 

H.8. Pricing for Options Not Listed, Provide % off MSRP & Provide List of Options

H.8.1. Vendors can list the discount by Category and then provide a listing of the options for that Category.
Several lines have been provided below to fill in the Categories. 

H.8.1.1. Category: Discount: % 

H.8.1.2. Category: Discount: % 

H.8.1.3. Category: Discount: % 

H.8.1.4. Category: Discount: % 

H.8.1.5. Category: Discount: % 

H.8.1.6. Category: Discount: % 

H.9. Pricing for Alternative Fuel Engines

H.9.1. Vendors can provide pricing for Alternative Fuel Engines that are available. Only Engine Configurations that
have been certified by all required Agencies can be submitted under this Section.  Several lines have been 
provided to provide Pricing. 

Chassis 

Body

Dealer Installed Options

25

25

25

Not Available

Type-C Base  / Route $7,000.00      Type-D Base  / Route: $8,150.00 
Note: Optional Air Conditioner Configurations listed under Section H.8.1.4 @ 25% off MSRP

Included 

Not Available
Type - C & D (Base)  $1,500.00 
Note: Optional Storage Configurations listed under H.8.1.2 @ 25% off MSRP

  Not Available   

$100.00

H.9.1.1. Engine Type:   (Type-C) Price:$  

H.9.1.2. Engine Type: 7.3L V8 Propane (Type-C) Price: $

H.9.1.3. Engine Type: __________ Price: $ 

H.9.1.4. Engine Type: ISL - CNG (Type-D (RE)) Price: $ 

H.9.1.5. Engine Type: Price: $ 

Air Conditioning Systems 25

NO BID

NO BID

$1,200.00 DEDUCT vs. applicable Type-C / Diesel configuration+

$4,750.00 INCREASE over applicable Type-C / Diesel configuration  

+$36,500.00 INCREASE over applicable Type-D (RE) / Diesel 
configuration

H.9.1.6. Engine Type: Price: $ 

NOTE REGARDING PRICING FOR OPTIONS NOT LISTED AND ALTERNATIVE FUEL ENGINES: 

If needed, a separate document may be provided if pricing varies dependent upon Passenger Capacity.  Vendors may 
submit 
separate documents for each Passenger Capacity model if needed.   

7.3L V8 Gasoline

ryanross
Highlight



 
 

2500 South Meridian • Oklahoma City, OK 73108-1744 
Office:  405-681-6691  • Toll Free:  800-965-7677  • Fax:  405-681-6693 

 
DISTRIBUTORS OF BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUSES 

 
 
 
Additional MFSAB - Configurations:  
 
 
Configuration #1: 
Type – C: 44 Passenger w/ High-back Activity seating: 
 
Options: FRT & Rear (In-wall) Air Conditioning, Dual Door Luggage Boxes (LH & RH sides), 
Stainless Steel Wheel Liners, Air Package: (Air Ride Rear Suspension, Air Door, Air Driver's Seat) 
w/ Hydraulic Brakes & Base Graphics Package Included.    
 
 Price:       $97,780.00 
 
--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
 
 
Configuration #2: 
Type – D: Rear Engine, 46 Passenger w/ High-back Activity seating: 
 
Options: Transit Style (Roof-Top) Air Conditioning w/ Ducted Overhead Luggage & Reading 
Lights, Pass-Through Luggage Compartment, Cast Aluminum Wheels, (Air Ride FRT & Rear 
Suspension, Air Door & Air Seat ) w/ Air Brakes & Base Graphics Package Included.   
 
 Price:       $149,785.00 
 
 
Note: Both configuration #1 & #2 (Listed Above) are priced while stock supplies last.   
If option content varies from Configuration #1 or #2, original contract pricing from sections H.2 
and H.4 will remain in effect. 








