
STATE OF OKLAHOMA
SW081 ASPHALT

Vendor Name:

All price quoted shall be FOB vendor's specified location.

Division 1 Division 2 Division 3 Division 4 Division 5 Division 6 Division 7 Division 8
PMI  47.00$           47.00$           47.00$           
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma

F.O.B. Plant

PMI 54.00$           54.00$           54.00$           
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma

F.O.B. Plant

Pavement Material Inc. - PMI

INSTRUCTIONS:  Specify plant location.  Place the price per unit of measure under the Division for which that plant will provide supply.  Some items below will apply to all divisions equally.  Several locations 
maybe provided under a product description by providing multiple plant locations.  Scroll down to see all items that need to be bid on.  The end of the pricing grid is specified by stating "End of Pricing Grid".

PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE
DESCRIPTION UOM PLANT LOCATION

Asphaltic Concrete SUPERPAVE 
TYPE S2 (PG-64-22-OK) TON

Asphaltic Concrete SUPERPAVE 
TYPE S2 (PG-70-28-OK) TON



Division 1 Division 2 Division 3 Division 4 Division 5 Division 6 Division 7 Division 8
PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE

DESCRIPTION UOM PLANT LOCATION

   
  

PMI 47.00$           47.00$           47.00$           
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma

F.O.B. Plant

PMI 54.00$           54.00$           54.00$           
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma

F.O.B. Plant

PMI 56.00$           56.00$           56.00$           
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma

F.O.B. Plant
TON

TON

Asphaltic Concrete SUPERPAVE 
TYPE S3 (PG-76-28-OK)

Asphaltic Concrete SUPERPAVE 
TYPE S3 (PG-70-28-OK) TON

Asphaltic Concrete SUPERPAVE 
TYPE S3 (PG-64-22-OK)



Division 1 Division 2 Division 3 Division 4 Division 5 Division 6 Division 7 Division 8
PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE

DESCRIPTION UOM PLANT LOCATION

   
  

PMI 54.45$           54.45$           54.45$           
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma

F.O.B. Plant

PMI 59.00$           59.00$           59.00$           
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma

F.O.B. Plant

PMI 61.50$           61.50$           61.50$           
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma

F.O.B. Plant

Asphaltic Concrete SUPERPAVE 
TYPE S4 (PG-70-28-OK) TON

TONAsphaltic Concrete SUPERPAVE 
TYPE S4 (PG-76-28-OK)

Asphaltic Concrete SUPERPAVE 
TYPE S4 (PG-64-22-OK) TON



Division 1 Division 2 Division 3 Division 4 Division 5 Division 6 Division 7 Division 8
PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE

DESCRIPTION UOM PLANT LOCATION

   
  

PMI 56.75$           56.75$           56.75$           
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma

F.O.B. Plant

PMI 62.45$           62.45$           62.45$           
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma

F.O.B. Plant

PMI 64.50$           64.50$           64.50$           
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma

F.O.B. Plant

TON

Asphaltic Concrete SUPERPAVE 
TYPE S5 (PG-76-28-OK) TON

Asphaltic Concrete SUPERPAVE 
TYPE S5 (PG-70-28-OK)

Asphaltic Concrete SUPERPAVE 
TYPE S5 (PG-64-22-OK)

TON



Division 1 Division 2 Division 3 Division 4 Division 5 Division 6 Division 7 Division 8
PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE

DESCRIPTION UOM PLANT LOCATION

   
  

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 

DESCRIPTION UOM PLANT LOCATION
PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE

PRICE FOR ALL DIVISIONS

50# Bag

TON

No Bid

Cold Patch, Asphalt, Proline High 
Performance Polymer Modified All 
Weather, All Season

Cold Patch, Asphalt, Proline High 
Performance Polymer Modified All 
Weather, All Season

Asphaltic Concrete Type MC-800 
(Stone Matrix Asphalt). Gradiation 
No. 3

TON

No Bid



Division 1 Division 2 Division 3 Division 4 Division 5 Division 6 Division 7 Division 8
PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE

DESCRIPTION UOM PLANT LOCATION

   
  

No Bid

No Bid

Perma-Patch TON

60# Bag

No Bid

Perma-Patch

Slycrete EV TON



Division 1 Division 2 Division 3 Division 4 Division 5 Division 6 Division 7 Division 8
PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE

DESCRIPTION UOM PLANT LOCATION

   
  

PMI
24001 S Broadway 
Moore Oklahoma No Bid

Hauling - Price Per Ton Per Mile MILE

No Bid

No BidCold patch, Asphalt, UPM 
Permanent Pavement Repair 
Material

50# Bag

Cold patch, Asphalt, UPM 
Permanent Pavement Repair 
Material

TON


	Pricing Grid

