



05/14/2020

Dear Awarded Supplier,

Oklahoma Statewide Contract SW0670 (4766) was awarded with the base agreement period commencing 06/01/2017 and ending 05/31/2021 with 3 options to renew for one-year periods. The State of Oklahoma is requesting to renew the above contract for the period of 06/01/2020 through 05/31/2021.

Please indicate your firm's response to this request and return by email.

- ☒ Yes, our firm will renew the contract pricing and terms on the above listed contract.  
☐ No, our firm will not renew the contract pricing and terms on the above listed contract.

Federal Employer / Tax Identification Number: 73- 1399635

PeopleSoft Identification Number: 339914

Company Name: BENTON COUNTY STONE - STILLWELL QUARRY

Address: P.O. BOX 988

City: PRYOR State: OK

Zip Code: 74362

Email: SALES@BENTONCOUNTYSTONE.COM

BRUCE PRITCHETT - SALES  
Name / Title

5/14/2020  
Date

Bruce Pritchett  
Signature

Send response electronically to the email address below of the contracting officer by: 05/18/2020 at 5 PM

Contracting Officer Name: Cini Zacharia

Contracting Officer Phone: (405) 522 - 9078

Contracting Officer Email Address: Cini.zacharia@omes.ok.gov

**Styrene Aggregates and Stone Materials**

[illegible]

\_\_\_\_\_

1. *Journal of the American Medical Association*, 1997; 277: 1039-1043.

85-2534

[illegible]

SM670 Aggregate and Stone Materials

All prices quoted must be FOB Vendors Railway.

U00040

[illegible]

ODOT Location		PRICE PER UNIT OF TON																				
Single Source	Material Source	Class "A" Sand	No. 2 Cover Aggregate	Aggregate Base Type "A"	Crusher Run 1 1/2"	Crusher Run 2"	Crusher Run 3"	Crusher Run 6"	Crusher Run 4" Cover	No. 30 - 50" Screenings	6" Surge Pulp	6" Aggregate Pulp	12" Aggregate Pulp	18" Aggregate Pulp	24" Aggregate Pulp	Single Course Paving Material	SCA-2	SCA-3	SCA-4	3/8" Road Stool	4-8" Gation Rock	
OSAGE COUNTY	OSAGE COUNTY																					
OSTAWA COUNTY	OSTAWA COUNTY																					
PAWNEE COUNTY	PAWNEE COUNTY																					
PEYNE COUNTY	PEYNE COUNTY																					
REYNOLDS COUNTY	REYNOLDS COUNTY																					
ROCKWORTH COUNTY	ROCKWORTH COUNTY																					
ROGER MARSH COUNTY	ROGER MARSH COUNTY																					
ROGERS COUNTY	ROGERS COUNTY																					
SEDMORE COUNTY	SEDMORE COUNTY																					
SEDFORD COUNTY	SEDFORD COUNTY	NO BID	\$20.40	\$16.80	\$15.75	\$15.75	\$15.75	\$18.75	NO BID	\$15.00	\$24.50	\$25.50	\$28.50	\$29.50	\$25.50	\$12.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.00	\$19.00	
STEPHENS COUNTY	STEPHENS COUNTY																					
TEXAS COUNTY	TEXAS COUNTY																					
TRIMARK COUNTY	TRIMARK COUNTY																					
WAGONER COUNTY	WAGONER COUNTY																					
WASHINGTON COUNTY	WASHINGTON COUNTY																					
WASHINGTON COUNTY	WASHINGTON COUNTY																					
WOODS COUNTY	WOODS COUNTY																					
WOODWARD COUNTY	WOODWARD COUNTY																					