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AMMUNITION: Handgun and Rifle

1.00 1.00 0.00 0.00

SEE VENDOR PRICE SHEETS FOR ITEMS AND PRICING

COMMENTS:

CONTRACT
Dispatch via Print

Contract ID
0000000000000000000003674

Page
1 of 1

Contract Dates
02/07/2014 to 02/06/2015

Currency
USD

Rate Type
CRRNT

Rate Date
PO Date

Description:
From Req ID - 0900002992

Contract Maximum
0.00

TYPE:  STATEWIDE

State of Oklahoma

Vendor ID 0000055310
PRECISION DELTA CORP
PO BOX 128
RULEVILLE MS 38771-0128

Tax Exempt? Y Tax Exempt ID:736017987

Line # Cat CD / Item ID / Item Desc
Minimum Order Maximum / Open
Qty Amt Qty Amt

Authorized SignatureFinal = The price is final after adjustments
Hard  = Apply adjustments regardless of other adjustments
Skip  = Skip adjustments if any other adjustments have been applied Original Signature on File in Central Purchasing
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STATE OF OKLAHOMA
SW220 Ammunition and Accessories

Vendor Name: PRECISION DELTA CORP

All prices quoted shall be FOB Destination

Brands that will be accepted: Federal, Winchester, 
Remington, Hornady, Speer, CCI

All Rounds to be new, unfired brass

Manufacturer
Manufacturer 

Item ID#  Price Per M 
Delivery 

ARO
Only the Manufacturer / Item # listed will be accepted 

on Lines 16-58
.223 Caliber, 62 Grain, Bonded Remington PRC223R4  No Bid 

.223 Caliber, 62 Grain, Closed Tip, Flat Base, Round Remington L223R9  No Bid 

.357 Caliber Sig, 125 Grain, Full Metal Jacket
Remington 

Golden Saber MC 357S1 No Bid

.357 Caliber, Sig, 125 Grain (LP) Speer Gold Dot 53918  No Bid 

.357 Caliber, Sig, Bonded Jacketed Hollow Point
Remington 

Golden Saber R357SI  No Bid 

.38 Caliber Special, 158 Grain, +P True Metal Jacket Speer Lawman 53750  No Bid 

.38 caliber, 125 Grain, Bonded Jacketed Hollow Point
Remington 

Golden Saber GS38SB  No Bid 

.38 Caliber, 158 Grain, Full Metal Jacket
Remington 

Golden Saber LSWC R38S6  No Bid 

.40 caliber, 165 Grain, Bonded Jacketed Hollow Point
Remington 

Golden Saber GS40SWA  No Bid 
.40 Caliber, 180 Grain Remington GSB20SWB  No Bid 

.40 Caliber, 180 Grain, Full Metal Jacket
Remington 

Golden Saber UMC L40SW3  No Bid 

.40 Caliber, 180 Grain, Gold Dot Hollow Point Speer Gold Dot 53962  No Bid 

.40 Caliber, 180 Grain, True Metal Jacket Speer Lawman 53652  No Bid 

.40 Caliber, S&W, 180 Grain, Full Metal Jacket, Flat Nose CCI 5220  No Bid 
.40 Caliber, S&W, 180 Grain, Hollow Point Federal C40SWA  No Bid 

.45 Caliber, 230 Grain, Bonded Jacketed Hollow Point
Remington 

Golden Saber GS45APB  No Bid 

.45 Caliber, 230 Grain, Full Metal Jacket
Remington 

Golden Saber UMC L45AP4  No Bid 

.45 Caliber, 230 Grain, Gold Dot Hollow Point Speer Gold Dot 53966  No Bid 

.45 Caliber, 230 Grain, True Metal Jacket Speer Lawman 53653  No Bid 
.45 Caliber, AUTO - NOT Colt, 185 Grain, Full Metal Jacket, 

Flat Nose Winchester USA45A                298.40 180+

380 Auto, 90 Grain Speer Gold Dot 53606  No Bid 

Item / Description
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.45 Caliber, GAP, 200 Grain Speer Lawman 53980  No Bid 
12 Gauge, #7 Shot, 2 3/4", 1 oz Remington GC1217  No Bid 
12 Gauge, #7 Shot, 2 3/4", 1 oz Remington GLSTL127  No Bid 
12 Gauge, #7 Shot, 2 3/4", 1 oz Winchester WE12GT7                266.80 180+
12 Gauge, #8 Shot, 2 3/4", 1 oz Remington XU128  No Bid 

12 Gauge, #9 Shot, 00 Buck, 2 3/4" Remington RR12  No Bid 
12 Gauge, #9 Shot, Heavy Target Winchester AAM129                342.00 180+

12 Gauge, #9 Shot, Reduced Recoil Remington RR12BK00  No Bid 

12 Gauge, #9 shot, 00 Buck, 2 3/4"
Remington 

Golden Saber 12B00  No Bid 
12 Gauge, 1 oz Slug, 2 3/4" Remington PB 1276RS  No Bid 
12 Gauge, 1 oz Slug, 2 3/4" Remington RR12RSB  No Bid 
12 Gauge, 1 oz, 2 3/4" Slugs Remington SPL9  No Bid 

12 Gauge, Slug, Reduced Recoil Remington RR122RSB  No Bid 
20 Gauge, #7 Shot, 2 3/4", 3/4 oz Remington GLSTL207  No Bid 
20 Gauge, #7 Shot, 2 3/4", 3/4 oz Winchester WE20GT7                308.00 180+
20 Gauge, #8 Shot, 2 3/4", 3/4 oz Remington GC208  No Bid 
20 Gauge, #8 Shot, 2 3/4", 7/8 oz Winchester XU208                377.20 180+

9mm, 124 Grain, Bonded Jacketed Hollow Point Remington GS9MMB  No Bid 
9mm, 147 Grain, Full Metal Jacket Remington L9MM9  No Bid 

9mm, 147 Grain, Gold Dot Hollow Point Speer Gold Dot 53619  No Bid 
9mm, 147 Grain, Hollow Point Remington GS9MMC  No Bid 

9mm, 147 Grain, True Metal Jacket Speer Lawman 53620  No Bid 

Manufacturer
Manufacturer 

Item ID#  Price Per M 
Delivery 

ARO
Only the Manufacturer listed will be accepted on 

Lines 62-68
.223 Caliber, 62 Grain Rifle Cartridge Hornady  No Bid 
.223 Caliber, 55 Grain Rifle Cartridge Remington  No Bid 

.357 Caliber, Sig, 125 Grain Remington  No Bid 
9mm, 124 Grain Remington  No Bid 

.40 Caliber, S&W, 165 Grain, Hollow Point
Remington 

Golden Sabre  No Bid 

380 ACP, 90 Grain Speer Gold Dot  No Bid 

.38 Caliber Special, 125 Grain, Hollow Point Speer Gold Dot  No Bid 

Item / Description
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Manufacturer
Manufacturer 

Item ID#  Price Per M 
Delivery 

ARO
Any Manufacturer listed above will be accepted on 

Lines 72-90

.223 Caliber, 55 Grain, Full Metal Jacket Rifle Cartridge Winchester USA223R1                366.30 180+ days

.357 Caliber Sig, 125 Grain, True Full Metal Jacket Winchester Q4309                378.60 180+ days

.38 Caliber Wad Cutter Winchester X38SMRP                357.00 180+ days
.40 Caliber, 155 Grain, True Full Metal Jacket  NO BID 

.40 Caliber, S&W, 165 Grain, TMJ Practice Winchester USA40SW                236.90 180+ days
.45 Caliber Automatic Colt Pistol, 255 Grain, True Full Metal 

Jacket  NO BID 
12 Gauge, 00 Buckshot, 9-.32-.33 Caliber Projectiles  NO BID 

12 Gauge, 1 oz Slug, 1 oz Hollow Point Winchester X12RS15                505.00 180+ days

12 Gauge, 00 Buckshot, 2 3/4" Winchester XB1200                487.80 180+ days

9mm, 115 Grain, True Full Metal Jacket Winchester Q4172                192.30 180+ days

9mm, 115 Grain, Full Metal Jacket Winchester Q4172                192.30 180+ days

9mm,+P 124 Grain, Jacketed Hollow Point Winchester RA9124TP                306.00 180+ days

9mm, 115 Grain, Range Winchester Q4172                192.30 180+ days

.223 Caliber, 55 Grain, Boat Tail Hollow Point, Match Grade  NO BID 

.223 Caliber, 55 Grain, Range Winchester USA223R1                366.30 180+ days

12 Gauge, #9 Shot, 00 Buck, Non Magnum Load Winchester RA1200HD                439.20 180+ days

12 Gauge, 7-7 1/2 oz, Non Magnum Load, Range Winchester TRGTL127                271.60 180+ days

.308 Caliber, 150 Grain, Boat Tail Hollow Point, Match Grade  NO BID 
.45 Caliber, Colt, 85 Grain, Hollow Point  NO BID 

Item / Description
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PRICE PER 

Manufacturer  CASE PRICE 
 

ARO
380 AUTO 95 gr Ranger Jacketed Hollow Point T-Series 500 
rds/case Winchester RA380T                236.30 180+ days

380 AUTO 95 gr Full Metal Jacket 500 rds/case Winchester Q4206                130.30 180+ days

380 AUTO 95 gr BEB-Winclean 500 rds/case Winchester WC3801                134.75 180+ days
38 SPL+P 130 gr Ranger Bonded Jacketed Hollow Point, 500 Winchester RA38B                221.65 180+ days

38 SPL 130 gr Full Metal Jacket 500 rds/case Winchester Q4171                144.95 180+ days
38 SPL 148 gr WadCutter 500 rds/case Winchester X38SMRP                178.50 180+ days

38 SPL 158 gr SemiWadCutter 500 rds/case Winchester X38WCPSV                144.95 180+ days
9MM Luger +P 124 gr Ranger Jacketed Hollow Point T-Series Winchester RA9124TP                153.00 180+ days
9MM Luger 124 gr Ranger Bonded Jackted Hollow Point 500 

rds/case Winchester RA9BA                181.00 180+ days
9MM Luger +P+ 127 gr Ranger Jacketed Hollow Point T-Series Winchester RA9TA                151.60 180+ days
9MM Luger 147 gr Ranger Jacketed Hollow Point T-Series 500 

rds/case Winchester RA9T                139.90 180+ days
9MM Luger 147 gr Ranger Bonded Jackted Hollow Point 500 Winchester RA9B                181.00 180+ days

9MM Luger +P 100 gr Ranger Frangible SF, 500 rd/case Winchester RA9SF                217.60 180+ days
9MM Luger 115 gr Full Metal Jacket, 500 rds/case Winchester Q4172                   96.15 180+ days

9MM Luger 124 gr Full Metal Jacket, 500 rds/case Winchester USA9MM                102.25 180+ days
9MM Luger NATO 124 gr Full Metal Jacket, 500 rds/case Winchester RA9124N                114.50 180+ days

9MM Luger 147 gr Full Metal Jacket-Truncated Cone, 500 
rds/case Winchester USA9MM1                116.25 180+ days

9MM Luger 115 gr BEB-Winclean, 500 rds/case Winchester WC91                110.00 180+ days

9MM Luger 124 gr BEB-Winclean, 500 rds/case Winchester WC92                110.00 180+ days
9MM Luger 147 gr BEB-Winclean, 500 rds/case Winchester WC93                113.75 180+ days

357 SIG 125 gr Ranger Jacketed Hollow Point T-Series 500 
rds/case Winchester RA357SIGT                238.00 180+ days

357 SIG 125 gr Ranger Bonded Jacketed Hollow Point, 500 Winchester RA357SB                261.25 180+ days

357 SIG 125 gr Ranger Frangible SF, 500 rd/case Winchester RA357SSF                312.25 180+ days
357 SIG 125 gr Full Metal Jacket Flat Nose, 500 rds/case Winchester Q4309                189.30 180+ days

357 SIG 125 gr BEB-Winclean, 500 rds/case Winchester WC357SIG                206.00 180+ days
40 S&W 165 gr Ranger Jacketed Hollow Point T-Series 500 Winchester RA40TA                167.70 180+ days
40 S&W 165 gr Ranger Bonded Jacketed Hollow Point, 500 

rds/case Winchester RA40BA                193.80 180+ days
40 S&W 180 gr Ranger Jacketed Hollow Point T-Series 500 Winchester RA40T                160.75 180+ days
40 S&W 180 gr Ranger Bonded Jacketed Hollow Point, 500 

rds/case Winchester RA40B                193.80 180+ days
40 S&W 135 gr Ranger Frangible SF, 500 rd/case Winchester RA40SF                267.50 180+ days

40 S&W 165 gr Full Metal Jacket, 500 rds/case Winchester USA40SW                118.45 180+ days
40 S&W 180 gr Full Metal Jacket, 500 rds/case Winchester Q4238                125.35 180+ days

40 S&W 165 gr BEB-Winclean, 500 rds/case Winchester WC401                128.35 180+ days
40 S&W 180 gr BEB-Winclean, 500 rds/case Winchester WC402                131.25 180+ days

45 G.A.P. Ranger Bonded Jacketed Hollow Point, 500 rds/case Winchester RA45GB                335.85 180+ days
45 G.A.P. Ranger Frangible SF, 500 rd/case Winchester RA45GSF                403.25 180+ days

Items Not Specifically Listed
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45 Auto 230 gr Ranger Jacketed Hollow Point T-Series 500 

rds/case Winchester RA45T                215.30 180+ days
45 Auto +P 230 gr Ranger Jacketed Hollow Point T-Series 500 Winchester RA45TP                215.30 180+ days

45 Auto 230 gr Ranger Bonded Jacketed Hollow Point, 500 
rds/case Winchester RA45B                242.25 180+ days

45 Auto 185 gr Full Metal Jacket, 500 rds/case Winchester USA45A                149.20 180+ days

45 Auto 230 gr Full Metal Jacket, 500 rds/case Winchester Q4170                147.95 180+ days
45 Auto 185 gr BEB-Winclean, 500 rds/case Winchester WC451                165.25 180+ days

45 Auto 230 gr BEB-Winclean, 500 rds/case Winchester WC452                160.70 180+ days

45 Auto +P 175 gr Ranger Frangible SF, 500 rd/case Winchester RA45SF                328.00 180+ days

5.56 mm 64 gr Ranger Bonded - Solid Base, 1,000 rds/case Winchester RA556B                804.78 180+ days
5.56 mm 62 gr Ranger Penetrator, 1,000 rds/case Winchester RA556M855K                 499.00 180+ days

.223 Rem 55 gr. Ranger Pointed Soft Pt, 200 rds/case Winchester RA223R                109.30 180+ days
.223 Rem 55 gr Ranger Frangible SF, 200 rd/case Winchester RA223SF                139.25 180+ days

.223 Rem 55 gr Ranger Supreme Ballistic Silvertip, 200 rd/case Winchester RA223BSTA                149.25 180+ days
.223 Rem 64 gr Ranger Power Point - Knurl, 200 rds/case Winchester RA223R2                108.25 180+ days

.223 Rem 69 gr. Ranger Match Hollow Point Boat Tail, 200 
rds/case Winchester RA223M                139.90 180+ days

.223 Rem 55 gr Full Metal Jacket, 1,000 rds/case Winchester USA223R1                366.30 180+ days

.223 Rem 62 gr Full Metal Jacket, 1,000 rds/case Winchester USA223R3                449.45 180+ days
5.56 mm 55 gr Full Metal Jacket, 1,000 rds/case Winchester Q3131                366.30 180+ days

308 Win 150 gr Ranger Power Point, 200 rds/case Winchester X3085                156.85 180+ days
308 Win 150 gr Ranger Supreme Ballistic Silvertip, 200 rd/case Winchester SBST308                205.45 180+ days

308 Win 168 gr Ranger Supreme Ballistic Silvertip, 200 rd/case Winchester SBST308A                205.45 180+ days
308 Win 168 gr Ranger Match Hollow Point Boat Tail, 200 Winchester S308M                188.80 180+ days

12 GA 2 3/4 in.  Ranger 9 Pellet 00 Buck  Low Recoil, 25 
rd/box; 250 rd/case Winchester RA1200                107.20 180+ days

12 GA 2 3/4 in. Ranger  9 Pellet 00 Buck Low Recoil, 5 rd/bx; Winchester RA12005                124.90 180+ days
12 GA 2 3/4 in. Ranger 9 Pellet 00 Buck, 25 rd/box; 250 

rd/case        Winchester RA1200HD                109.80 180+ days
12 GA 2 3/4 in. 9 Pellet 00 Buck, 5 rd/bx; 250 rds/case            Winchester XB1200                121.95 180+ days

12 GA 2 3/4 in. Ranger  8 Pellet 00 Buck Low Recoil, 5 rd/bx; 
250 rds/case Winchester RA120085                123.80 180+ days

12 GA 2 3/4 in Ranger 00 BuckFrangible, 25 rd/box; 250 Winchester RA1200SF                287.00 180+ days
12 GA 2 3/4 in.  Ranger  1 oz.Rifled Slug Low Recoil, 5 rd/bx; 

250 rds/case Winchester RA12RS15                127.55 180+ days
12 GA 2 3/4 in. Ranger 1 oz. Segmenting Slug, 5 rd/bx; 250 Winchester RA12RS15S                138.55 180+ days

12 GA 2 3/4 in. 1 oz. Rifled Slug, 5 rd/bx; 250 rds/case           Winchester X12RS15                126.25 180+ days
12 GA 2 3/4 in Ranger Frangible Slug, 250 rds/ case       Winchester RA12RSSF                377.45 180+ days

12 GA 2 3/4 in 2 3/4 dr 1oz # 7 1/2 shot, 250 rds/case Winchester TRGTL127                   67.90 180+ days
12 GA 2 3/4 in 2 3/4 dr 1oz # 9 shot, 250 rds/case Winchester TRGTL129                   67.90 180+ days

12 GA 2 3/4 in 2 3/4 dr 1 1/8oz # 7 1/2 shot, 250 rds/case Winchester TRGT127                   67.90 180+ days
12 GA 2 3/4 in 3 dr 1 1/8oz # 7 1/2 shot, 250 rds/case Winchester AAM127                   81.40 180+ days
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12 GA 2 3/4 in 3 1/4 dr 1oz #7 1/2 shot, 250 rds/case Winchester WE12GT7                   66.70 180+ days
22 Long Rifle 37 gr High Vel Lead Hollow Point, 5,000 rds/case Winchester X22LRH                213.85 180+ days

22 Long Rifle   40 gr Lead Round Nose, 5,000 rds/case Winchester XT22LR                198.50 180+ days
22 Long Rifle Wildcat  40 gr Lead Round Nose, 5,000 rds/case Winchester WW22LR                214.50 180+ days
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